
  ORDINANCE NO. 240-18
 
AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND SECTION 5-01 AND TO REPEAL AND REENACT
SECTION 5-0102 OF THE REVISED ORDINANCES OF 2000 OF THE CITY OF
MAPLETON RELATING TO THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MAPLETON, NORTH
DAKOTA: 

SECTION 1.  Section 5-0101 of the Revised Ordinances of 2000

of the City of Mapleton is hereby amended and reenacted to read as

follows:

5-0101. Adoption of International Building Code.  The
erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving,
removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height,
area, and maintenance of buildings or structures in the City of
Mapleton, North Dakota, shall meet with the provisions of the rules
and regulations of the 2009 2015 edition of the International
Building Code, of the International Code Council as the same are
now established in said code, a copy of which is on file in the
office of the building inspector for the City of Mapleton, with the
exception of the sections hereinafter set forth affecting local
conditions in the City of Mapleton, which sections shall be
substituted for and in lieu of like sections or paragraphs in said
International Building Code; and the City Council of said City of
Mapleton, by this section hereby approves and adopts such rules and
regulations, as so modified, for use and application in the City of
Mapleton, North Dakota, as well as for any area within the
extraterritorial zoning jurisdiction of the City.  Provided, that
any amendments of the 2009 2015 edition of the International
Building Code may be adopted by the City by resolution.

SECTION 2.  Section 5-0102 of the Revised Ordinances of 2000

of the City of Mapleton is hereby repealed and reenacted to read as

follows:

5-0102. Modification of International Building Code. The
International Building Code as adopted in Section 5-0101 is hereby
changed and amended as follows: 

SECTION 101.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[A] 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known
as the Building Code of (NAME OF JURISDICTION) the
City of Mapleton hereinafter referred to as “this
code.”

SECTION 101.4.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[A] 101.4.3  Plumbing. The provisions of the
International Plumbing Code North Dakota State
Plumbing Code shall apply to the installation,



alteration, repair and replacement of plumbing
systems, including equipment, appliances, fixtures,
fittings and appurtenances, and where connected to
a water or sewage system and all aspects of a
medical gas system. The provisions of the
International Private Sewage Disposal Code North
Dakota State Plumbing Code shall apply to private
sewage disposal systems.

SECTION 101.4.7 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[A] 101.4.7 Existing buildings.  The provisions of the
International Existing Building Code shall apply to
matters governing the repair, alteration, change of
occupancy, addition to and relocation of existing
buildings.

Exception:  Existing buildings may use Chapter 34
of the IBC 2012 as an alternative to using the IEBC
2015.

SECTION 101.4.8 is hereby added to read as follows:

Section 101.4.8.  Where this code refers to flood
requirements, the local jurisdiction flood plain
management ordinance shall apply.

SECTION 104.2.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.        

SECTION 104.8 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[A] 104.8 Liability.  The building official, member of
the board of appeals or employee charged with the
enforcement of this code. While acting for the
jurisdiction in good faith and without malice in the
discharge of the duties required by this code or other
pertinent law or ordinance, shall not thereby be civilly
or criminally rendered liable personally and is hereby
relieved from personal liability for any damage accruing
to persons or property as a result of any act or by
reason of an act or omission in the discharge of official
duties. Any suit instituted against an officer or
employee because of an act or omission performed by that
officer or employee in the lawful discharge of duties and
under the provisions of this code shall be afforded all
the protection provided by the city’s insurance pool and
immunities and defenses provided by other applicable
state and federal laws and shall be defended by legal
representative of the jurisdiction until the final
termination of the proceedings. The building official or
any subordinate shall not be liable for cost in any

-2-



action, suit or proceeding that is instituted in
pursuance of the provisions of this code.  

This code shall not be construed to relieve from or
lessen the responsibility of any person owning,
operating, or controlling any building or structure for
any damages to persons or property caused by defects, nor
shall the code enforcement agency or the city be held as
assuming any such liability by reason of the inspection
authorized by this code or any permits or certificates
issued under this code.

SECTION 104.8.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 104.10.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 105.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

105.2 Work exempt from permit.  Exemptions . . .

Building:

1.  One-story detached accessory structures used as
tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar
used, provided the floor area is not greater than
120 square feel (11 m2).
2.  Fences not over 7 8.5 feet (2134 2591 mm) high.
3.  Oil derricks.  . . .

6. Sidewalks and driveways not more than 30
inches(762 mm) above adjacent grade, and not over
any basement or story below and are not  part of an
accessible route. . . .

11. Swings and other playground equipment accessory
to detached one- and two-family dwellings.
12. Window awnings in Group R-3 and U occupancies
supported by an exterior wall that do not project
more than 54 inches (1372 mm) from the exterior
wall and do not require additional support.
13. Non-fixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks,
counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches
(1753 mm) in height.
14. Reroofing.

SECTION 107.2.5.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

    SECTION 107.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[A] 107.3.1. Approval of construction documents.  When
the building official issues a permit, the construction
documents shall be approved, in writing or by stamp, as

-3-



“Reviewed for Code Compliance.”  One set of construction
documents so reviewed shall be retained by the building
official.  The other set shall be returned to the
applicant, shall be kept at the site of work and shall be
open to inspection by the building official or a duly
authorized representative.  

SECTION 109.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[A] 109.2 Schedule of permit fees.  On buildings,
structures, electrical, gas, mechanical, and plumbing
systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each
permit and plan review shall be paid as required, in
accordance with the schedule as established by the
applicable governing authority City Council. The plan
review fees specified in this subsection are separate
from, and in addition to, permit fees.  When submittal
documents are incomplete or changed so as to require
additional plan review or when the project involves
deferred submittal items as defined in Section 106.3.4.2,
an additional plan review fee shall be charged in an
amount not to exceed 50% of the building permit fee
established in Section 108.2.

SECTION 110.3.3 is hereby deleted in its entirety and
subsequent sections renumbered accordingly.

SECTION 110.3.10.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 113 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 201.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

201.3  Terms defined in other codes.  Where terms are not
defined in this code and are defined in the International
Energy Conservation Code, International Fuel Gas Code,
International Fire Code, International Mechanical Code or
International Plumbing Code other referenced codes as
adopted by the jurisdiction, such terms shall have the
meanings ascribed to them as in those coded.

SECTION 305.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

305.2.  Group E, day care facilities. This group includes
buildings and structures or portions thereof occupied by
more than five twelve children older than 21/2 years of
age who receive educational, supervision or personal care
services for fewer than 24 hours per day.

-4-



SECTION 305.2.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

305.2.2  Five Twelve or fewer children. A facility having
five twelve or fewer children receiving such day care
shall be classified as part of the primary occupancy.

SECTION 305.2.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

305.2.3  Five Twelve or fewer children in a dwelling
unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit
and having five twelve or fewer children receiving such
day care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or
shall comply with the International Residential Code.

SECTION 308.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:

308.6 Institutional Group I-4, day care facilities. 
Institutional Group I-4 occupancy shall include buildings
and structures occupied by more than five twelve persons
of any age who receive custodial care for fewer then 24
hours per day by persons other than parents or guardians,
relatives by blood, marriage or adoption, and in a place
other than the home of the person cared for.  This group
shall include, but not be limited to, the following:

Adult day care
Child day care

SECTION 308.6.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

308.6.1 Classification as Group E. A child day care
facility that provides care for more than five twelve but
no more than 100 children 21/2 years or less of age,
where the rooms in which the children are cared for are
located on a level of exit discharge serving such rooms
and each of these child care rooms has an exit door
directly to the exterior, shall be classified as Group E.

SECTION 308.6.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

308.6.3 Five Twelve or fewer persons receiving care.  A
facility having five twelve or fewer persons receiving
custodial care shall be classified as part of the primary
occupancy.

SECTION 308.6.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

308.6.4 Five Twelve or fewer persons receiving care in a
dwelling unit.  A facility such as the above within a
dwelling unit and having five twelve or fewer persons
receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group

-5-



R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the International
Residential Code.

SECTION 406.3.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

406.3.4.1 Dwelling unit separation. The private
garage shall be separated from the dwelling unit
and its attic area by means of gypsum board, not
less than 1/2 inch (12.7 mm) in thickness, applied
to the garage side.  Garages beneath habitable
rooms shall be separated from all habitable rooms
above by not less than a 5/8-inch (15.9 mm) Type X
gypsum board or equivalent and 1/2-inch (12.7 mm)
gypsum board applied to structures supporting the
separation from habitable rooms above the garage. 
Door openings between a private garage and the
dwelling unit shall be equipped with either solid
wood doors or solid or honeycomb core steel doors
not less than 1 3/8 inches (34.9 mm) in thickness,
or doors in compliance with Section 716.5.3 with a
fire protection rating of not less than 20 minutes. 
Doors shall be self-closing and self-latching.

SECTION 706.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:

706.6 Vertical continuity.   Fire walls shall extend from
the foundation to a termination point not less than 30
inches (762 mm) above both adjacent roofs.

Exceptions:
1.  Stepped buildings in accordance with Section
706.6.1.
2.  Two-hour . . .

6.  Buildings with sloped roofs in accordance with
Section 706.6.2.
7. Fire walls installed within detached structures
of Group U or Group S-2 occupancies may terminate
at the underside of the roof sheathing provided
such walls are not required to be fire-resistive
construction due to proximity to property lines.

SECTION 801.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety:

SECTION 903.3.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[F] 903.3.1.1 NFPA 13 sprinkler systems. Where the
provisions of this code require that a building or
portion thereof be equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with this section,
sprinklers shall be installed throughout in accordance
with NFPA 13 except as provided in Sections 903.3.1.1.1
and 903.3.1.1.2.  Sprinkler heads in unoccupied mall

-6-



tenant spaces may be installed at ceiling height if
allowed by the code official. Permission will be granted
on an individual basis.  Combustible storage shall not be
allowed in these unoccupied tenant spaces if sprinkler
heads are installed at ceiling height. Signage shall be
provided where required. 

SECTION 905.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[F] Section 905.1. General.  Standpipe systems shall be
provided in new buildings and structures in accordance
with Sections 905.2 through 905.10.  In buildings used
for high-piled combustible storage, fire protection shall
be in accordance with the International Fire Code.

Exception:  The installation of fire hose on
standpipes may be omitted when approved by the fire
code official.  Approved standpipe hose valves and
connection shall be provided where required.

SECTION 907.2.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[F] 907.2.3 Group E.  A manual fire alarm system that
initiates the occupant notification signal utilizing an
emergency voice/alarm communication system meeting the
requirements of Section 907.5.2.2 and installed in
accordance with Section 907.6 shall be installed in Group
E occupancies.  When automatic sprinkler systems or smoke
detectors are installed, such systems or detectors shall
be connected to the building fire alarm system.  Where
approved by the fire code official, a building’s
emergency communication system interfaced with the fire
alarm system in accordance with NFPA 72 is acceptable.

SECTION 907.2.11.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[F] 907.2.11.1 Group R-1.  Single- or multiple-station
smoke alarms shall be installed in all of the following
locations in Group R-1:

1.  In sleeping areas.
2.  In every room in the path of the means of
egress from the sleeping area to the door leading
from the sleeping unit.
3.  In each story within the sleeping unit,
including basements.  For sleeping units with split
levels and without an intervening door between the
adjacent levels, a smoke alarm installed on the
upper level shall suffice for the adjacent lower
level provided that the lower level is less than
one full story below the upper level.
4.  In dwelling units where the ceiling height of a
room open to the hallway serving the sleeping rooms
exceeds that of the hallway by 24 inches (610 mm)

-7-



or more, smoke detectors shall be installed in the
hallway and in the adjacent room.

SECTION 907.2.11.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[F] 907.2.11.2 Groups R-2, R-3, R-4 and I-1.  Single or
multiple-station smoke alarms shall be installed and
maintained in Groups R-2, R-3, R-4 and I-1 regardless of
occupant load at all of the following locations.  

1.  On the ceiling or wall outside of each separate
sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of
bedrooms.
2.  In each room used for sleeping purposes.
3.  In each story within a dwelling unit, including
basements but not including crawl spaces and
uninhabitable attics.  In dwellings or dwelling
units with split levels and without an intervening
door between the adjacent levels, a smoke alarm
installed on the upper level shall suffice for the
adjacent lower level provided that the lower level
is less than one full story below the supper level. 

4.  In dwelling units where the ceiling height of a
room open to the hallway serving the sleeping rooms
exceeds that of the hallway by 24 inches (610 mm)
or more, smoke detectors shall be installed in the
hallway and in the adjacent room.

SECTION 1011.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1011.1 General. Stairways serving occupied portions of a
building shall comply with the requirements of Sections
1011.2 through 1011.13. Alternating tread devices shall
comply with Section 1011.14. Ships ladders shall comply
with Section 1011.15. Ladders shall comply with
Section 1011.16.

Exceptions:
1. Within rooms or spaces used for assembly
purposes, stepped aisles shall comply with
Section 1029.
2. Stairways used only to attend equipment or
private stairways serving an occupant load of
10 or fewer persons and which are not
accessible to the public.

SECTION 1011.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1011.2 Width and capacity. The required capacity of
stairways shall be determined as specified in
Section 1005.1, but the minimum width shall be not less

-8-



than 44 inches (1118 mm). See Section 1009.3 for
accessible means of egress stairways.

Exceptions:
1.  Stairways serving an occupant load of less than
50 shall have a width of not less than 36 inches
(914 mm).
2.  Spiral stairways as provided for in Section
1011.10.
3.  Where an incline platform lift or stairway
chairlift is installed on stairways serving
occupancies in Group R-3, or within dwelling units
in occupancies in Group R-2, a clear passage width
not less than 20 inches (508 mm) shall be provided.
Where the seat and platform can be folded when not
in use, the distance shall be measured from the
folded position.
4.  Stairways used only to attend equipment or
private stairways serving an occupant load of 10 or
fewer persons and which are not accessible to the
public.

SECTION 1011.5.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1011.5.2 Riser height and tread depth.  Stair riser …

… treads at the intersections with the walk line and a
minimum tread depth of 10 inches (254 mm) within the
clear width of the stair.

Exceptions:
1.  Spiral stairways …

5.  In Group I-3 facilities, stairways providing
access to guard towers, observation stations and
control rooms, not more than 250 square feet (23 m2)
in area, shall be permitted to have a maximum riser
height of 8 inches (203 mm) and a minimum tread
depth of 9 inches (229 mm).
6. Stairways used only to attend equipment or
private stairways serving an occupant load of 10 or
fewer persons and which are not accessible to the
public are permitted to have a maximum 8 inch riser
height and minimum 9 inch tread depth. 

SECTION 1011.11 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1011.11 Handrails. Stairways shall have handrails on each
side and shall comply with Section 1014. Where glass is
used to provide the handrail, the handrail shall comply
with Section 2407.

-9-



Exceptions:
1.  Stairways within …

4. Changes in room elevations of three or fewer
risers within dwelling units and sleeping units in
Group R-2 and R-3 do not require handrails.
5. Stairways used only to attend equipment or
private stairways serving an occupant load of 10 or
fewer persons and which are not accessible to the
public.
6. Vehicle service pit stairways are exempt from
the rules for stairway railings and guards if they
would prevent a vehicle from moving into a position
over the pit.

SECTION 1015.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1015.2 Where required. Guards shall be located along
open-sided walking surfaces, including mezzanines,
equipment platforms, aisles, stairs, ramps and landings
that are located more than 30 inches (762 mm) measured
vertically to the floor or grade below at any point
within 36 inches (914 mm) horizontally to the edge of the
open side above the floor or grade below or if within 36
inches (914 mm) horizontally to the edge of the open side
the vertical measurement to the floor or grade below is
greater than 48 inches. Guards shall be adequate in
strength and attachment in accordance with
Section 1607.8.

SECTION 1104.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1104.4  Multilevel buildings and facilities. At least one
accessible route shall connect each accessible story and
mezzanine in multilevel buildings and facilities.

Exceptions:

1. An accessible route is not required to
stories, basements and mezzanines that have an
aggregate area of not more than 3,000 square
feet (278.7 m2) and are located above and or
below accessible levels and are below the
third story. This exception shall not apply
to:

1.1. Multiple tenant facilities of Group
M occupancies…

-10-



SECTION 1203.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1203.1 General. Buildings shall be provided with natural
ventilation in accordance with Section 1203.4, or
mechanical ventilation in accordance with the
International Mechanical Code. 

Where the air infiltration rate in a dwelling unit is
less than 5 air changes per hour when tested with a
blower door at a pressure 0.2 inch w.c. (50 Pa) in
accordance with Section R402.4.1.2 of the International
Energy Conservation Code Residential Provisions, the
dwelling unit shall be ventilated by mechanical means in
accordance with Section 403 of the International
Mechanical Code.  Ambulatory care facilities and Group
I-2 occupancies shall be ventilated by mechanical means
in accordance with Section 407 of the International
Mechanical Code.

SECTION 1207 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 1403.6 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 1403.7 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 1507.2.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1507.2.6 Fasteners.  Fasteners for asphalt shingles shall
be galvanized, stainless steel, aluminum, or copper
roofing nails, minimum 12 gage [0.105 inch (2.67 mm)]
shank with a minimum 3/8- inch-diameter (9.5 mm) head, of
a length to penetrate through the roofing materials and
a minimum of 3/4 inch (19.1 mm) into the roof sheathing
or other fasteners as approved by the building official
and shingle manufacturer.  Where the roof sheathing is
less than 3/4 inch (19.1 mm) thick, the nails shall
penetrate through the sheathing.  Fasteners shall comply
with ASTM F1667.

SECTION 1511 is hereby deleted and relocated as Appendix N.

SECTION 1601.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1601.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall govern
the structural design of buildings, structures and
portions thereof regulated by this code.

It shall not be the responsibility of the building
official to determine engineering requirements of this
code. Exclusive of the conventional light-framing wood
construction provisions referenced in Section 2308, the
method to resist loads as referenced in this chapter is

-11-



the responsibility of a structural engineer or other
qualified design professional.

SECTION 1603.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1603.1  General.  Construction documents shall show the
size, section and relative locations of structural
members with floor levels, column centers and offsets
dimensioned. The design loads and other information
pertinent to the structural design required by Sections
1603.1.1 through 1603.1.8 shall be indicated on the
construction documents.

Exception: Construction documents for buildings
constructed in accordance with the conventional
light-frame construction provisions of Section 2308
shall indicate the following structural design
information:

1. Floor and roof live loads.
2. Ground snow load, Pg. …

5. Flood design data, if located in flood
hazard areas established in Section 1612.3.

 6. Design load-bearing values of soils.

SECTION 1603.1.7 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 1610.1 exception is hereby amended to read as follows:

1610.1 General.  Foundation walls and retaining walls .
. .

Exception:  Foundation walls extending not more
than 8 9 feet (2438 mm) below grade and laterally
supported at the top by flexible diaphragms shall
be permitted to be designed for active pressure.

SECTION 1612 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 1804.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1804.4 Site grading. The ground immediately adjacent to
the foundation shall be sloped away from the building at
a slope of not less than one unit vertical in 20 units
horizontal (5-percent slope) for a minimum distance of 10
feet (3048 mm) measured perpendicular to the face of the
wall. If physical obstructions or lot lines prohibit 10
feet (3048 mm) of horizontal distance, a 5-percent slope
shall be provided to an approved alternative method of
diverting water away from the foundation. Swales used for
this purpose shall be sloped a minimum of 2 percent where
located within 10 feet (3048 mm) of the building

-12-



foundation. Impervious surfaces within 10 feet (3048 mm)
of the building foundation shall be sloped a minimum of
2 percent away from the building Surface drainage shall
be diverted to a storm sewer conveyance or other approved
point of collection. Lots shall be graded to drain
surface water away from foundation walls.

Exception: Where climatic or soil conditions
warrant, the slope of the ground away from the
building foundation shall be permitted to be
reduced to not less than one unit vertical in 48
units horizontal (2-percent slope).

The procedure used to establish the final ground level
adjacent to the foundation shall account for additional
settlement of the backfill.

SECTION 1804.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 1805.1.2.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 1809.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1809.5.  Frost protection.  Except where otherwise
protected from frost, foundations and other permanent 
supports of buildings and structures shall be protected
from frost by one or more of the following methods:

1.  Extending below the frost line of the locality.
2.  Constructing in accordance with ASCE 32.
3.  Erecting on solid rock.

Exception: Free-standing buildings meeting all
of the following conditions shall not be
required to be protected:

1. Assigned to Risk Category I.
2. Area of 600 square feet (56 m2) or
less for light-frame construction or 400
square feet (37 m2) or less for other
than light-frame construction.
3. Eave height of 10 feet (3048 mm) or
less.
4. Free-standing buildings used as Group
U occupancies for the storage of private
or pleasure-type vehicles constructed in
accordance with Sections 406.3.1

Shallow foundations shall not bear on frozen soil unless
such frozen condition is of a permanent character.

-13-



SECTION 2901.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:  

[P] 2901.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter and the
International Plumbing Code North Dakota State Plumbing
Code shall govern the erection, installation, alteration,
repairs, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or
maintenance of plumbing equipment and systems. Plumbing
systems and equipment shall be constructed, installed and
maintained in accordance with the International Plumbing
Code North Dakota State Plumbing Code.  Private sewage
disposal systems shall conform to the International
Private Sewage Disposal Code North Dakota State Plumbing
Code.

SECTION 3102.7 is hereby amended to read as follows:

3102.7.  Engineering Design.  The structure shall be
designed and constructed to sustain dead loads, loads due
to tension or inflation, live loads including wind, snow
or flood and seismic loads and in accordance with Chapter
16.

SECTION 3109 is hereby deleted and relocated as Appendix O.

SECTION 3313 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

The following amendments are applicable to Chapter 34 of the
2012 International Building Code:

SECTION 3403.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 3404.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 3405.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 3409.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 3410.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

3410.1  Conformance.  Structures moved into or within the
jurisdiction shall comply with the provisions of this
code for new structures.   

SECTION 3412.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

3412.2 Applicability.  Structures existing prior to 1952
[DATE TO BE INSERTED BY THE JURISDICTION. NOTE: IT IS
RECOMMENDED THAT THIS DATE COINCIDE WITH THE EFFECTIVE
DATE OF BUILDING CODES WITHIN THE JURISDICTION], in which
there is work involving additions, alterations or changes
of occupancy shall be made to comply with the
requirements of this section or the provisions of

-14-



Section 3403 through 3409. The provisions in Section
3412.2.1 through 3412.2.5 shall apply to existing
occupancies that will continue to be, or are proposed to
be, in Group A, B, E, F, M, R, S and U. These provisions
shall not apply to buildings with occupancies in Group H
or I.

SECTION 3412.2.4.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 3.  Effective Date.  This ordinance shall be in full

force and effect from and after the date of its final passage and

publication. 

________________________________
Mayor

 
ATTEST: 
 

________________________________
City Auditor 

Date of First Reading: 
 
Date of Second Reading:
 
Date of Publication: 

F:\MUNI\MAPLE\ORDINANCES\CODEAMENDS\BLDG\2018\ORD240-18.WPD

-15-


