TITLE V.

BUILDINGS
CHAPTERS:

5-01. International Building Code. (ord. 206-11)
5-02. Dangerous Buildings.
5-03. Moving Buildings.

5-04. Flood Damage Prevention.

5-05. Minimum Housing Standards.

5-06. International Property Maintenance Code. (ord. 209-11)
5-07. 1International Residential Code. (ord. 210-11)

5-08. 1International Existing Building Code. (ord. 211-11)

5-09. International Energy Conservation Code. (ord. 212-11)



CHAPTER 5-01

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE
(Source: Ord. 206-11)

SECTIONS:

5-0101. Adoption of International Building Code.

5-0102. Modifications of International Building Code.
(Source: Ord. 240-18, Sec. 2)

5-0103. Penalty.

5-0104. Appeals

5-0101. Adoption of International Building Code. The
erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving,
removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height,
area, and maintenance of buildings or structures in the City of
Mapleton, North Dakota, shall meet with the provisions of the rules
and regulations of the 2015 edition of the International Building
Code, of the International Code Council as the same are now
established in said code, a copy of which is on file in the office
of the Building Administrator for the City of Mapleton, with the
exception of the sections hereinafter set forth affecting local
conditions in the City of Mapleton, which sections shall be
substituted for and in lieu of like sections or paragraphs in said
International Building Code; and the City Council of said City of
Mapleton, by this section hereby approves and adopts such rules and
regulations, as somodified, for use and application in the City of
Mapleton, North Dakota, as well as for any area within the
extraterritorial zoning jurisdiction of the City. Provided, that
any amendments of the 2015 edition of the International Building
Code may be adopted by the City by resolution.

Source: Ord. 240-18, Sec. 1

5-0102. Modification of International Building Code. The
International Building Code as adopted in Section 5-0101 is hereby
changed and amended as follows:

SECTION 101.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[A] 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known
as the Building Code of ANAMEOFTURISBICTFION) the
City of Mapleton hereinafter referred to as “this
code.”

SECTION 101.4.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[A] 101.4.3 Plumbing. The provisions of the
ITrternationat—FPtuombing—€Code North Dakota State

5-1-1



Plumbing Code shall apply to the installation,
alteration, repair and replacement of plumbing
systems, including equipment, appliances, fixtures,
fittings and appurtenances, and where connected to
a water or sewage system and all aspects of a
medical gas system. The ©provisions of the

ITnternational Private Sewage Disvosal Code North
tnternaty nal F=rivat >ewWag HI-SPOSat al

Dakota State Plumbing Code shall apply to private
sewage disposal systems.

SECTION 101.4.7 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[A] 101.4.7 Existing buildings. The provisions of the
International Existing Building Code shall apply to
matters governing the repair, alteration, change of
occupancy, addition to and relocation of existing
buildings.

Exception: Existing buildings may use Chapter 34
of the IBC 2012 as an alternative to using the IEBC
2015.

SECTION 101.4.8 is hereby added to read as follows:

Section 101.4.8. Where this code refers to flood
requirements, the local Jjurisdiction flood plain
management ordinance shall apply.

SECTION 104.2.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 104.8 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[A] 104.8 Liability. The building official, member of
the Dboard of appeals or employee charged with the
enforcement of this code. While acting for the
jurisdiction in good faith and without malice in the
discharge of the duties required by this code or other
pertinent law or ordinance, shall not thereby be civitty
or k,J_Jl_lllJ._llall_y rendered liable personally and 1is hereby
relieved from personal liability for any damage accruing
to persons or property as a result of any act or by
reason of an act or omission in the discharge of official
duties. Any suit instituted against an officer or
employee because of an act or omission performed by that
officer or employee in the lawful discharge of duties and
under the provisions of this code shall be afforded all
the protection provided by the city’s insurance pool and
immunities and defenses provided by other applicable
state and federal laws and shall be defended by legal
representative of the jurisdiction until the final
termination of the proceedings. The building official or
any subordinate shall not be liable for cost in anv

5-1-2



action, suit or ©proceeding that is instituted in
pursuance of the provisions of this code.

This code shall not be construed to relieve from or
lessen the responsibility of any person owning,
operating, or controlling any building or structure for
any damages to persons or property caused by defects, nor
shall the code enforcement agency or the city be held as
assuming anvy such liabilityv by reason of the inspection
authorized by this code or anv permits or certificates
issued under this code.

SECTION 104.8.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 104.10.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 105.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
105.2 Work exempt from permit. Exemptions
Building:
1. One-story detached accessory structures used as
tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar
used, provided the floor area is not greater than
120 square feel (11 m,).

2. Fences not over #+ 8.5 feet (2334 2591 mm) high.
3. 0il derricks. .

0. Sidewalks and driveways Tot more e 36
Yy

. 1 Vi | ) AV 1 1 . .l .l e
LIICIICSTS (70 LTI albuUvc adu jaciLccllit yYyLadauc, alll 1100 OUVCTL

any-basement or story below and are not—partof an

2ccessible route
= te.

7
OO 3o ES =3

11. Swings and other playground equipment accessory

12. Window awnings 1T GLuuy R—3—=arra—H uppupaupico
t

A 1 1 - . 4 4
SUPPULLTU DYy dlIITALTL TUL " WdadLl L

1 A \| A : A
11t UuU 11O L PLUJTTCL

more—than 54 inches (1372 mm) from the exterior
wall and do not require additional support.
13. Non-fixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks,

S
counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches
(1753 mm) in height.

14. Reroofing.

SECTION 107.2.5.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 107.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
[A] 107.3.1. Approval of construction documents. When

the building official issues a permit, the construction
documents shall be approved, in writing or by stamp, as

5-1-3



7

“Reviewed for Code Compliance.” One set of construction
documents so reviewed shall be retained by the building
official. Flre—other—set—stati—Pe——returmed—to—the

AP a 12 O = S O O O

ornen o 1nernection Wy +he hiii 1311y nffioi2a] Avr 3 A1l <z

peh—ceo—3hsSP cFoR—oy &3 o+ a+hg T+ CF3+ F—a—Cau=Y
SECTION 109.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[A] 109.2 Schedule of permit fees. On buildings,

structures, electrical, gas, mechanical, and plumbing
systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each
permit and plan review shall be paid as required, in
accordance with the schedule as established by the
appticabte—goverming—authority City Council. The plan
review fees specified in this subsection are separate
from, and in addition to, permit fees. When submittal
documents are incomplete or changed so as to reqgquire
additional plan review or when the project involves
deferred submittal items as defined in Section 106.3.4.2,
an additional plan review fee shall be charged in an
amount not to exceed 50% of the building permit fee
established in Section 108.2.

SECTION 110.3.3 is hereby deleted in its entirety and
subsequent sections renumbered accordingly.

SECTION 110.3.10.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 113 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 201.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

201.3 Terms defined in other codes. Where terms are not

defined in this code and are defined in the International

I Vol + - Vol = T 4+ + - 7 I 7 yal ral =
J_l.llC_LEj_y CUlloT L Va L LUIDT CUUT , LITCCOC L IIAC L UIIAd L L UT L ud o CcUuUcT,

International RPlumbing Code other referenced codes as
adopted by the jurisdiction, such terms shall have the
meanings ascribed to them as in those coded.

SECTION 305.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

305.2. Group E, day care facilities. This group includes
buildings and structures or portions thereof occupied by
more than fi+ve twelve children older than 21/2 years of
age who receive educational, supervision or personal care
services for fewer than 24 hours per day.

5-1-4



SECTION 305.2.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

305.2.2 Five Twelve or fewer children. A facility having
five twelve or fewer children receiving such day care
shall be classified as part of the primary occupancy.

SECTION 305.2.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

305.2.3 ¥Five Twelve or fewer children in a dwelling
unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit
and having fi+ve twelve or fewer children receiving such
day care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or
shall comply with the International Residential Code.

SECTION 308.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:

308.6 Institutional Group I-4, day care facilities.
Institutional Group I-4 occupancy shall include buildings
and structures occupied by more than five twelve persons
of any age who receive custodial care for fewer then 24
hours per day by persons other than parents or guardians,
relatives by blood, marriage or adoption, and in a place
other than the home of the person cared for. This group
shall include, but not be limited to, the following:

Adult day care
Child day care

SECTION 308.6.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

308.6.1 Classification as Group E. A child day care
facility that provides care for more than five twelve but
no more than 100 children 21/2 years or less of age,
where the rooms in which the children are cared for are
located on a level of exit discharge serving such rooms
and each of these child care rooms has an exit door
directly to the exterior, shall be classified as Group E.

SECTION 308.6.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

308.6.3 Five Twelve or fewer persons receiving care. A
facility having five twelve or fewer persons receiving
custodial care shall be classified as part of the primary
occupancy.

SECTION 308.6.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

308.6.4 Five Twelve or fewer persons receiving care in a
dwelling unit. A facility such as the above within a
dwelling unit and having five twelve or fewer persons
receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group
R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the International
Residential Code.

5-1-5



SECTION 406.3.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

406.3.4.1 Dwelling unit separation. The private
garage shall be separated from the dwelling unit
and its attic area by means of gypsum board, not
less than 1/2 inch (12.7 mm) in thickness, applied
to the garage side. Garages beneath habitable
rooms shall be separated from all habitable rooms
above by not less than a 5/8-inch (15.9 mm) Type X
gypsum board or equivalent and 1/2-inch (12.7 mm)
gypsum board applied to structures supporting the
separation from habitable rooms above the garage.
Door openings between a private garage and the
dwelling unit shall be equipped with either solid
wood doors or solid or honeycomb core steel doors
not less than 1 3/8 inches (34.9 mm) in thickness,
or doors in compliance with Section 716.5.3 with a
fire protection rating of not less than 20 minutes.

Doore chall bha calf-rnlncing and caelf-Jla+rtchinga
= FS—SHa=+—= © S+ +— O ST+ Hg—aRo—Ser+r=xatchiih S

SECTION 706.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:

706.6 Vertical continuity. Fire walls shall extend from
the foundation to a termination point not less than 30
inches (762 mm) above both adjacent roofs.

Exceptions:

1. Stepped buildings in accordance with Section
706.6.1.

2. Two-hour

6. Buildings with sloped roofs in accordance with
Section 706.6.2.

7. Fire walls installed within detached structures
of Group U or Group S-2 occupancies may terminate
at the underside of the roof sheathing provided
such walls are not required to be fire-resistive
construction due to proximity to property lines.

SECTION 801.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety:
SECTION 903.3.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[F] 903.3.1.1 NFPA 13 sprinkler systems. Where the
provisions of this code require that a building or
portion thereof be equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system 1in accordance with this section,
sprinklers shall be installed throughout in accordance
with NFPA 13 except as provided in Sections 903.3.1.1.1
and 903.3.1.1.2. Sprinkler heads in unoccupied mall
tenant spaces may be installed at ceiling height if

5-1-6



allowed by the code official. Permission will be granted
on an individual basis. Combustible storage shall not be
allowed in these unoccupied tenant spaces if sprinkler
heads are installed at ceiling height. Signage shall be
provided where required.

SECTION 905.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[F] Section 905.1. General. Standpipe systems shall be
provided in new buildings and structures in accordance
with Sections 905.2 through 905.10. In buildings used
for high-piled combustible storage, fire protection shall
be in accordance with the International Fire Code.

Exception: The installation of fire hose on
standpipes may be omitted when approved by the fire
code official. Approved standpipe hose valves and
connection shall be provided where required.

SECTION 907.2.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[F] 907.2.3 Group E. A manual fire alarm system that
initiates the occupant notification signal utilizing an
emergency voice/alarm communication system meeting the
requirements of Section 907.5.2.2 and installed in
accordance with Section 907.6 shall be installed in Group
E occupancies. When automatic sprinkler systems or smoke
detectors are installed, such systems or detectors shall
be connected to the building fire alarm system. Where
approved by the fire code official, a building’s
emergency communication system interfaced with the fire
alarm system in accordance with NFPA 72 is acceptable.

SECTION 907.2.11.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[F] 907.2.11.1 Group R-1. Single- or multiple-station
smoke alarms shall be installed in all of the following
locations in Group R-1:
1. 1In sleeping areas.
2. In every room 1in the path of the means of
egress from the sleeping area to the door leading
from the sleeping unit.
3. In each story within the sleeping unit,
including basements. For sleeping units with split
levels and without an intervening door between the
adjacent levels, a smoke alarm installed on the
upper level shall suffice for the adjacent lower
level provided that the lower level is less than
one full story below the upper level.
4. In dwelling units where the ceiling height of a
room open to the hallway serving the sleeping rooms
exceeds that of the hallway by 24 inches (610 mm)

5-1-7



or more, smoke detectors shall be installed in the
hallway and in the adjacent room.

SECTION 907.2.11.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[F] 907.2.11.2 Groups R-2, R-3, R-4 and I-1. Single or
multiple-station smoke alarms shall be installed and
maintained in Groups R-2, R-3, R-4 and I-1 regardless of
occupant load at all of the following locations.
1. On the ceiling or wall outside of each separate
sleeping area 1in the 1immediate vicinity of
bedrooms.
2. In each room used for sleeping purposes.
3. In each story within a dwelling unit, including
basements but not including crawl spaces and
uninhabitable attics. In dwellings or dwelling
units with split levels and without an intervening
door between the adjacent levels, a smoke alarm
installed on the upper level shall suffice for the
adjacent lower level provided that the lower level
is less than one full story below the supper level.

4. In dwelling units where the ceiling height of a
room open to the hallway serving the sleeping rooms
exceeds that of the hallway by 24 inches (610 mm)
or more, smoke detectors shall be installed in the
hallway and in the adjacent room.

SECTION 1011.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1011.1 General. Stairways serving occupied portions of a
building shall comply with the requirements of Sections
1011.2 through 1011.13. Alternating tread devices shall
comply with Section 1011.14. Ships ladders shall comply
with Section 1011.15. Ladders shall comply with
Section 1011.16.

Exceptions:

1. Within rooms or spaces used for assembly
purposes, stepped aisles shall comply with
Section 1029.

2. Stairways used only to attend eguipment or
private stairways serving an occupant load of
10 or fewer persons and which are not
accessible to the public.

SECTION 1011.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
1011.2 Width and capacity. The required capacity of

stairways shall Dbe determined as specified 1in
Section 1005.1, but the minimum width shall be not less

5-1-8



than 44 inches (1118 mm). See Section 1009.3 for
accessible means of egress stairways.

Exceptions:
1. Stairways serving an occupant load of less than
50 shall have a width of not less than 36 inches

(914 mm) .
2. Spiral stairways as provided for in Section
1011.10.
3. Where an incline platform 1lift or stairway

chairlift is installed on stairways serving
occupancies in Group R-3, or within dwelling units
in occupancies in Group R-2, a clear passage width
not less than 20 inches (508 mm) shall be provided.
Where the seat and platform can be folded when not
in use, the distance shall be measured from the
folded position.

4. Stairways used only to attend equipment or
private stairways serving an occupant load of 10 or
fewer persons and which are not accessible to the

public.

SECTION 1011.5.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
1011.5.2 Riser height and tread depth. Stair riser ..
. treads at the intersections with the walk line and a

minimum tread depth of 10 inches (254 mm) within the
clear width of the stair.

Exceptions:
1. Spiral stairways ..
5. In Group I-3 facilities, stairways providing

access to guard towers, observation stations and
control rooms, not more than 250 square feet (23 m,)
in area, shall be permitted to have a maximum riser
height of 8 inches (203 mm) and a minimum tread
depth of 9 inches (229 mm).

6. Stairways used only to attend eguipment or
private stairways serving an occupant load of 10 or
fewer persons and which are not accessible to the
public are permitted to have a maximum 8 inch riser
height and minimum 9 inch tread depth.

SECTION 1011.11 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1011.11 Handrails. Stairways shall have handrails on each
side and shall comply with Section 1014. Where glass is
used to provide the handrail, the handrail shall comply
with Section 2407.

Exceptions:
1. Stairways within ..

5-1-9



4. Changes in room elevations of three or fewer
risers within dwelling units and sleeping units in
Group R-2 and R-3 do not require handrails.

5. Stairwavys used only to attend eguipment or
private stairways serving an occupant load of 10 or
fewer persons and which are not accessible to the
public.

6. Vehicle service pit stairways are exempt from
the rules for stairway railings and guards if thevy
would prevent a vehicle from moving into a position
over the pit.

SECTION 1015.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1015.2 Where required. Guards shall be located along
open-sided walking surfaces, including mezzanines,
equipment platforms, aisles, stairs, ramps and landings
that are located more than 30 inches (762 mm) measured

" | K. ] Wi | | h) | . . .
verLtlittally Lo L1IIT 1 TOUUL UL gL auc DTCTLTUW d U adlry PO LTITC

Wit].lJl_ll 3() J‘.llbllcb (914 1lllll) }.J.ULJ‘.AUthd.ll_y tU t].lU cdgc Uf tllb
operr—stde above the floor or grade below or if within 36
inches (914 mm) horizontally to the edge of the open side
the vertical measurement to the floor or grade below is
greater than 48 inches. Guards shall be adequate in
strength and attachment in accordance with
Section 1607.8.

SECTION 1104.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1104.4 Multilevel buildings and facilities. At least one
accessible route shall connect each accessible story and
mezzanine in multilevel buildings and facilities.

Exceptions:

1. An accessible route 1is not required to
stories, basements and mezzanines that have an
aggregate area of not more than 3,000 square
feet (278.7 m,) and are located above =amd or
below accessible levels and are below the
third story. This exception shall not apply
to:

1.1. Multiple tenant facilities of Group
M occupancies..

SECTION 1203.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1203.1 General. Buildings shall be provided with natural
ventilation 1in accordance with Section 1203.4, or
mechanical ventilation in accordance with the
International Mechanical Code.

5-1-10



& a O AW W
la—1 i} . ral e} LN D AV .
DLIUWTL UOU UL ad U [} PLTSSULT U LITCTII W. T {JU rdad) L 11
3o rdancae with Sacst1 -~ DAND A ] 2 of +the Tntreornatianal
& rdan with -Sectior R4024 12 the International
Energy Conservation Code Residential Provisions, the
dwelling unit shall be ventilated by mechanical means in
Yoo rAdanoao Wit Secti1on A0 of +he ITnternationnal
dan with —Section—40 t—=¢h International
Mechanical Code~ Ambulatory care facilities and Group

I-2 occupancies shall be ventilated by mechanical means
in accordance with Section 407 of the International
Mechanical Code.

SECTION 1207 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 1403.6 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 1403.7 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 1507.2.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1507.2.6 Fasteners. Fasteners for asphalt shingles shall
be galvanized, stainless steel, aluminum, or copper
roofing nails, minimum 12 gage [0.105 inch (2.67 mm) ]
shank with a minimum 3/8- inch-diameter (9.5 mm) head, of
a length to penetrate through the roofing materials and
a minimum of 3/4 inch (19.1 mm) into the roof sheathing
or other fasteners as approved by the building official
and shingle manufacturer. Where the roof sheathing is
less than 3/4 inch (19.1 mm) thick, the nails shall
penetrate through the sheathing. Fasteners shall comply
with ASTM Fl667.

SECTION 1511 is hereby deleted and relocated as Appendix N.
SECTION 1601.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1601.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall govern
the structural design of buildings, structures and
portions thereof regulated by this code.

It shall not be the responsibility of the building
official to determine engineering regquirements of this
code. Exclusive of the conventional light-framing wood
construction provisions referenced in Section 2308, the
method to resist loads as referenced in this chapter is
the responsibility of a structural engineer or other
gqualified design professional.

SECTION 1603.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1603.1 General. Construction documents shall show the
size, section and relative 1locations of structural
members with floor levels, column centers and offsets
dimensioned. The design loads and other information

5-1-11



pertinent to the structural design required by Sections
1603.1.1 through 1603.1.8 shall be indicated on the
construction documents.

Exception: Construction documents for buildings
constructed in accordance with the conventional
light-frame construction provisions of Section 2308
shall indicate the following structural design
information:

1. Floor and roof live loads.

2. Ground snow load, Pg.

5.— Flood design data, if located in flood
hazard areas established in Section 1612 .3,
6. Design load-bearing values of soils.

SECTION 1603.1.7 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 1610.1 exception is hereby amended to read as follows:

1610.1 General. Foundation walls and retaining walls .

Exception: Foundation walls extending not more
than 8 9 feet (2438 mm) below grade and laterally
supported at the top by flexible diaphragms shall
be permitted to be designed for active pressure.

SECTION 1612 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 1804.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

- - ol | . o 3 1 . .
1804.4 Site gradlng. e gLuuuu.mecuLatc¢y gaJaceIrt Co
L = | W 1 1 1 1 1 | = L 1 .1 I e
CITS TOUNMOaCIOIT SITarff O SIToPpeU away [rom tire ouIrrarng act

ul W e ul ] e N ul . laWal .
d o1l0Upc UL 1IUOL 1Too Llildll UllT Uulllt vl Llladal 111 U ullrLto

1l . e ] L . 1 AY _— . . 1o . Nl BAY
HHNOL 1L 401ICadl (O pTLUUCTIlU o1L0OPT) LOUL 4 lllLITLIINUIL ULoLdllLTe UL LU

_— e \ . o i . . _— — e
LTl |\ O Iy IMTcadao UL TU PTLPTIIULTCULAdL LU LIIT LdLT UL LIIT
h] . ul h| e I | I loo daa o 1 A
pllyolttdadl UUDSLLUULULLUIIS UL 1TOUOUL 11T PLUINLIUDLT 1U
Q
[©]
o

\ Wadlilh) . e ul 1o e I e
iy oL 1oL L ZUlltadal ULl otdllte, 4d J7pPTLUTTIIU S 1LUPT

I N e = i) = I ot Q ul 1 o
UL vclL U1l WadlLTl dwdy LLUID LIIT LOUOUIIUdU LUl oWd1lTo UsSTU LUL

I P h| 1.1 1 ul 1 . . el e h|
LITL o PULPUST SlIdl L DT S 1LUPTU d IITLITLITUIl UL PTELUTIIU WIIT LT

] e 1 LI, P Al = e L AN N QO A} Wy i) h| L I

L0CadatlLtTU WL LIITLII LU LTl (oUa0 LILL) UL LIIT DULIULIIY
Wy T o T . = LI, 1N o e LN N Q \
LOUUIIUatCL LUl TIPSl V1IUUS ScUL LdUCTSos WILLIILIT LU LTTUL (OoUT O 1)

Uf thc L)UJ_ldJ_llkj fuuud_atiuu Dllc{ll bc oluycd ad lllJ._llJl_lllulll Uf

percent—away fromthe buleiug Surface drainage shall
be diverted to a storm sewer convevance or other approved
point of collection. Lots shall be graded to drain
surface water away from foundation walls.

5-1-12



i i : : . . T g

L Ja . . ul LD . ul A\
UllL s 1L L Z4UIlTUal (27 pTcrcTllit s 1LoupT) .

The procedure used to establish the final ground level
adjacent to the foundation shall account for additional
settlement of the backfill.

SECTION 1804.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 1805.1.2.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 1809.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1809.5. Frost protection. Except where otherwise
protected from frost, foundations and other permanent
supports of buildings and structures shall be protected
from frost by one or more of the following methods:

1. Extending below the frost line of the locality.
2. Constructing in accordance with ASCE 32.
3. Erecting on solid rock.
Exception: Free-standing buildings meeting all
of the following conditions shall not be
required to be protected:
1. Assigned to Risk Category I.
2. Area of 600 square feet (56 m2) or
less for light-frame construction or 400
square feet (37 m2) or less for other
than light-frame construction.
3. Eave height of 10 feet (3048 mm) or
less.
4. Free-standing buildings used as Group
U occupancies for the storage of private
or pleasure-type vehicles constructed in
accordance with Sections 406.3.1

Shallow foundations shall not bear on frozen soil unless
such frozen condition is of a permanent character.

SECTION 2901.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

[P] 2901.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter and the
Frteraationat Pluutb;uy €ode North Dakota State Plumblnq
Code shall govern the erection, installation, alteration,
repairs, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or
maintenance of plumbing equipment and systems. Plumbing
systems and equipment shall be constructed, installed and
maintained in accordance with the fatermatiormatPtumbing
Code North Dakota State Plumbing Code. Private sewage
disposal systems shall conform to the Frtermationmat

Code.

5-1-13



SECTION 3102.7 is hereby amended to read as follows:

3102.7. Engineering Design. The structure shall be
designed and constructed to sustain dead loads, loads due
to tension or inflation, live loads including wind, snow
or—ftood and seismic loads and in accordance with Chapter

16.

SECTION 3109 is hereby deleted and relocated as Appendix O.

SECTION 3313 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

The following amendments are applicable to Chapter 34 of the
2012 International Building Code:

SECTION

SECTION

SECTION

SECTION

SECTION

3403.2
3404.2
3405.5
3409.2
3410.1

is

is

is

is

hereby
hereby
hereby

hereby

deleted in

deleted in

deleted in

deleted in

its entirety.
its entirety.
its entirety.
its entirety.

read as follows:

is hereby amended to

3410.1 Conformance. Structures moved into or—witiri the
jurisdiction shall comply with the provisions of this
code for new structures.

SECTION 3412.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

3412. 2.App11cab111ty tructures ex1st1ng'prlor to 1952

LN A ITANQITDMIIT  TXZ  [mIT T T QN T M M
LUVALL J_U DL LINOLINILD DI L UUL\J.OLJJ_\/J_J_UL\I. J.\IUJ_JL. J_J_ J.O

RECOMMENDE D THAT THIS DATECOINCIDEWTITHTHE EFFECTEVE
PAFEOF B EFE NG CODES WETHIN-THEJORESBTFCTFONT, in which
there is work involving additions, alterations or changes
of occupancy shall be made to comply with the
requirements of this section or the provisions of
Section 3403 through 3409. The provisions in Section
3412.2.1 through 3412.2.5 shall apply to existing
occupancies that will continue to be, or are proposed to
be, in Group A, B, E, F, M, R, S and U. These provisions
shall not apply to buildings with occupancies in Group H
or I.

SECTION 3412.2.4.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

5-0103. Penalty. Any person violating any provision of the

International Building Code adopted by this title or any section of
this title shall be guilty of an infraction and shall be subject to
the penalties set forth in Section 1-0211. Each day such violation
continues shall be considered a separate offense.

5-1-14



5-0104. Appeals. A person shall have the right to appeal a
decision of the Code Official to the Board of Appeals. The
Mapleton Council shall be the Board of Appeals. An appeal in
writing to the Code Official must be made within 20 days of the
decision of the Code Official. The Mapleton City Council shall
hear the appeal within 30 days of the Code Official receiving

written notice of the appeal. The Council may only reverse or
modify a decision of the Code Official by a vote of at least three
members of the Council. If not all members of the Council are

present at the hearing, the person appealing the decision may
request a postponement, which may extend the 30-day period to hold
such a hearing. An application for an appeal shall be based on a
claim that the true intent of the Code has been incorrectly
interpreted, the provisions of the Code do not fully apply, or an
equally good or better form of construction is proposed. The
Council shall have no authority to waive requirements of the Code.

5-1-15



SECTIONS:

CHAPTER 5-02

DANGEROUS BUILDINGS

5-0201. Definitions

5-0202. Standards for Repair, Vacation, or Demolition.
5-0203. Dangerous Buildings - Nuisances.

5-0204. Duties of Building Administrator.

5-0205. Duties of City Council.

5-0206. Owner Absent from the City.

5-0207. Appeal.

5-0208. Penalty.

5-0201. DEFINITIONS. All buildings or structures which have
any or all of the following defects shall be deemed "dangerous
buildings":

(a)

Those whose interior walls or other vertical structural
members lean, list or buckle to such an extent that a
plumb line passing through the center of gravity falls
outside of the middle third of its base.

Those which, exclusive of the foundation, show
thirty-three percent or more of damage or deterioration
of the supporting member or members, or fifty percent of
damage or deterioration of the nonsupporting enclosing or
outside walls or covering.

Those which have improperly distributed loads upon the
floors or roofs or in which the same are overloaded, or
which have insufficient strength to be reasonably safe
for the purpose used.

Those which have been damaged by fire, wind, or other
causes so as to have become dangerous to life, safety,
morals, or the general health and welfare of the
occupants or the people of the city.

Those which have become, or are, so dilapidated, decayed,
unsafe or unsanitary or which so utterly fail to provide
the amenities essential to decent living that they are
unfit for human habitation or are likely to cause or
aggravate sickness or disease, so as to work injury to
the health, morals, safety, or general welfare of those
living therein.

5-2-1



(f) Those having light, air, and sanitation facilities which
are inadequate to protect the health, morals, safety or
general welfare of human beings who live or may live
therein.

(g) Those having inadequate facilities for egress in case of
fire or panic or those having insufficient stairways,
elevators, fire escapes, or other means of communication.

(h) Those which have parts thereof which are so attached that
they may fall and injure members of the public or
property.

(1) Those which because of their condition are unsafe,
unsanitary or dangerous to the health, morals, safety or
general welfare of the people of this city.

(7) Those buildings existing in violation of any provision of
the Building Code, zoning ordinances, any provision of
the Fire Prevention Code or other ordinances of this
city.

5-0202. STANDARDS FOR REPAIR, VACATION, OR DEMOLITION. The
following standards shall be followed in substance by the Board of
City Council in ordering repair, vacation, or demolition:

(a) If the "dangerous building" can reasonably be repaired so
that it will no longer exist in violation of the terms of
this chapter, it shall be ordered repaired.

(b) If the "dangerous building”™ is in such condition as to
make it dangerous to the health, morals, safety, or
general welfare of its occupants it shall be ordered to
be wvacated.

(c) In any case where a "dangerous building" is fifty percent
damaged, decayed, or deteriorated from its original value
or structure, it shall be demolished, and in all cases
where a building cannot be repaired so that it will no
longer be in violation of the terms of this chapter, it
shall be demolished. 1In all cases where a "dangerous
building"™ 1s a fire hazard existing or erected in
violation of the terms of this chapter or any ordinance
of this city or statute of the state of North Dakota, it
shall be demolished.

5-0203. DANGEROUS BUILDINGS - NUISANCES. All "dangerous
buildings" within the terms or Section 5-0201 are hereby declared
to be public nuisances and shall be repaired, vacated, or
demolished as hereinbefore and hereinafter provided.

5-2-2



5-0204. DUTIES OF BUILDING ADMINISTRATOR. The building
administrator shall:

(a)

Inspect any building, wall, or structure about which
complaints are filed by any person to the effect that a
building, wall, or structure is or may be existing in
violation of this chapter.

Inspect any building, wall, or structure reported (as
hereinafter provided for) by any agent of the City as
probably existing in violation of the terms of this
chapter.

Notify in writing the owner, occupant, lessee, mortgagee,
and all other persons having an interest 1in said
building, as shown by the records in the office of the
register of deeds of the county of Cass, of any building
found by the building administrator to be a "dangerous
building" within the standards set forth in
Section 5-0201 of this chapter, that: (1) the owner must
vacate, or repair, or demolish said building in
accordance with the terms of the notice and this chapter;
(2) the owner or occupant must vacate said building or
may have it repaired in accordance with the notice and
remain in possession. Provided, that any person notified
under this subsection to repair, vacate, or demolish any
building shall be given such reasonable time, not
exceeding thirty days, as may be necessary to do, or have
done, the work or act required by the notice provided for
herein.

Set forth in the notice provided for in subsection (c)
hereof a description of the building, or structure deemed
unsafe, a statement of the particulars which make the
building or structure a "dangerous building," and an
order requiring the same to be put in such condition as
to comply with the terms of this ordinance within such
length of time, not exceeding thirty days, as 1is
reasonable.

Report to the City Council any noncompliance with the
"notice" provided for in subsections (c) and (d) hereof.

Appear at all hearings conducted by the City Council and
testify as to the condition of "dangerous buildings."

Place a notice on all "dangerous buildings" reading as
follows: "This building has been found to be a 'dangerous
building' by the building administrator. This notice is
to remain on this building until it is repaired, vacated,
or demolished in accordance with the notice which has
been given the owner, occupant, lessee, or mortgagee of
this building and all other persons having an interest in
said building as shown by the records of the register of

5-2-3



deeds of the county of Cass. It is unlawful to remove
this notice until such notice is complied with."

5-0205. DUTIES OF CITY COUNCIL. The City Council shall:

(a)

Upon receipt of a report of the building administrator as
provided for in Section 5-0204, subsection (e), give
written notice to the owner, occupant, mortgagee, lessee
and all other persons having an interest in said building
as shown by the records of the register of deeds of the
county of Cass to appear before it on the date specified
in the notice to show cause why the building or structure
reported to be a "dangerous building" should not be
repaired, vacated, or demolished in accordance with the
statement of particulars set forth in the building
administrator's notice provided for  herein in
Section 5-0204, subsection (d).

Hold a hearing and hear such testimony as the building
inspector or the owner, occupant, mortgagee, lessee or
any other person having an interest in said building as
shown by the records of the register of deeds of the
county of Cass shall offer relative to the "dangerous
building".

Make written findings of fact from the testimony offered
pursuant to subsection (b) as to whether or not the
building in question is a "dangerous building" within the
terms of Section 5-0201.

Issue an order based upon findings of fact made pursuant
to subsection (c) hereof commanding the owner, occupant,
mortgagee, lessee, and all other persons having an
interest in said building as shown by the records of the
register of deeds of the County of Cass to repair,
vacate, or demolish any building found to be a "dangerous
building" within the terms of this chapter and provided
that any person so notified, except the owners, shall
have the privilege of either vacating or repairing said
"dangerous building".

If the owner, occupant, mortgagee, or lessee fails to
comply with the order provided for in subsection (d)
hereof, within thirty days, the City Council shall cause
such building or structure to be repaired, vacated, or
demolished as the facts may warrant, under the standards,
hereinbefore provided for in Section 5-0202 of this
chapter. The cost to the City of Mapleton of demolishing,
repairing or removing any building or structure under
this chapter shall be determined by the City Council
after written notice to the property owner of a hearing
thereon; and shall then be certified to the County
Auditor as a special assessment levied upon the described

5-2-4



property and to be spread upon the taxes against said
property.

(f) Report to the city attorney the names of all persons not
complying with the order provided for in subsection (d)
of this section.

5-0206. OWNER ABSENT FROM THE CITY. All notices or orders
provided for herein shall be sent by registered mail to such owner,
occupant, lessee or mortgagee, and all other persons having an
interest in said building, to the last known address of each, and
a copy of such notice shall be posted in a conspicuous place on the
"dangerous building" to which it relates. Suchmailing and posting
shall be deemed adequate service.

5-0207. APPEAL. The owner and the occupant shall have thirty
(30) days from the date of the order provided for in Section 5-0205
hereof in which to appeal to the Courts from the action of the City
Council. The City Council shall not demolish, repair, or remove
the building or structure or cause the same to be done during the
period of time herein provided for appeal.

5-0208. PENALTY. Any person violating any section of this
chapter shall be guilty of an infraction and shall be subject to
the penalties set forth in Section 1-0211. Each day such violation
continues shall be considered a separate offense.

5-2-5



CHAPTER 5-03

MOVING BUILDINGS

SECTIONS:

5-0301. Permit Required.
5-0302. Permit Application.

5-0303. Information Contained for Permit Application.
5-0304. Building Permit Required.
5-0305. House-Mover's License - Requirements.

5-0306. Removal of Overhead Wires and Cables - Notice.
5-0307. Removal of Attached Wires, Cables and Pipes.
5-0308. Building in Street - Warning Light Required.
5-0309. Equipment in Street - Lights Required.

5-0301. PERMIT REQUIRED. No person shall move, remove, raise
or support free of its foundation, any building or structure within
the limits of the City of Mapleton, or cause or hire said work to
be done, or assist in said work, unless a permit for said work has
been obtained from the City of Mapleton in accordance with the
provisions of this chapter.

5-0302. PERMIT APPLICATION. No permit to move, remove, raise
or support free of its foundation, any building or structure within
the limits of the City of Mapleton shall be issued until written
application for permit has been filed with the City Engineer on
forms provided by the City of Mapleton, and the application for
permit has been approved by the City Auditor. The City Auditor in
granting a moving permit may condition the permit upon the
applicant meeting certain conditions such as having a licensed
mover move the building, time limits in which the building must be
moved, routes that must be followed, posting a bond, and any other
similar conditions as deemed advisable by the City Auditor. Any
person denied a moving permit or contesting any conditions placed
on the permit, may appeal to the City Council, who shall review the
permit and its conditions at its next regularly scheduled meeting.

5-0303. INFORMATION CONTAINED FOR PERMIT APPLICATION.
Written application for permit to move, remove, ralise or support
free of its foundation any building or structure within the limits
of the City of Mapleton shall contain the following information
concerning the building or structure to be moved, removed, raised
or supported:

1 Date of application.

2 Name and address of applicant for permit.

3. Name and address of owner of building.

4 Name and address of person, firm or corporation the
applicant for permit will employ to do the moving.

5. Size of building or structure.

5-3-1



Age and general description of building or structure.
Location of building or structure at time of making
application.

~J o

8. Proposed new location for building or structure.

9. Route or road along which it is proposed to move the
building or structure from present location to proposed
new location.

10. Condition of building or structure at time application is
made for permit.
11. How long the moving of building or structure is expected

to take and when moving is expected to be completed if
permit is granted.

12. What changes in condition of building or structure will
be made after building or structure is moved to proposed
new location, and when these changes will be completed.

5-0304. BUILDING PERMIT REQUIRED. No moving permit shall be
granted to a structure being moved into the city limits of the City
of Mapleton unless and until the applicant also receives a building
permit from the Building Administrator.

5-0305. HOUSE-MOVER'S LICENSE - REQUIREMENTS. The City
Auditor may require as a condition to the approval of application
for permit and issuance of permit under this chapter that the
moving be done only by one holding a license for the moving of
buildings and structures within the City of Mapleton. No such
license shall be granted until the person applying therefor shall
have paid to the City Auditor a license fee of Five Dollars
($5.00), and shall have given a surety bond payable to the City in
the sum of Five Thousand Dollars ($5,000), on a form satisfactory
to the City Auditor, and conditioned, among other things, that said
party will pay any and all damages which may be caused to any
property, either public or private, within the City, whether said
damages or injury be inflicted by said party, his employees, agents
or workmen; and conditioned also that said party will save and
indemnify and keep harmless the said City against all liabilities,
judgments, costs and expenses which may in any way accrue against
the City in consequence of the granting of such license, and will
in all things strictly comply with the provisions of this chapter
and with the conditions of any and all permits which may be issued
hereunder to said house-mover or one employing him.

Upon the execution of such bond, and its acceptance by the
City Auditor, the "house-mover's" license for the moving of
buildings and structures within the City of Mapleton shall be
issued. All such licenses shall expire one (1) year from date of
issue.

5-0306. REMOVAL OF OVERHEAD WIRES AND CABLES - NOTICE.

1. In every case in which a permit shall be issued as herein
provided for the removal of any house or structure, when
such removal requires the displacement of any overhead
electrical or other wire or cable, it shall be the duty

5-3-2



of the person, association or corporation owning,
operating or controlling such wire or cable to remove or
displace the same as far as may be necessary to permit
the removal of such house, building or structure.

2. The person to whom a removal permit shall have been
issued shall notify the ©person, association or
corporation owning, operating or controlling such wire or
cable, to remove or displace the same to facilitate the
removal of said house, building or structure and shall
exhibit to said person, association or corporation the
properly issued permit authorizing the removal of said
house, building or structure, and it shall thereupon be
the duty of said person, association or corporation,
within a reasonable time, not exceeding twenty-four (24)
hours thereafter to remove or displace such wires or
cables sufficiently to allow the passage of said house,
building or structure.

5-0307. REMOVAL OF ATTACHED WIRES, CABLES AND PIPES. The
person to whom a removal permit has been issued shall, before
raising, moving or removing any building or structure to which
electric wires are attached, notify the persons, associations or
corporations owning or controlling such electric wiring, cables or
piping of the proposed moving of said building or structure. The
person, association or corporation so notified shall within a
reasonable time, not exceeding twenty-four (24) hours, thereafter,
disconnect and make safe all such electric wiring, cables or

piping.

5-0308. BUILDING IN STREET - WARNING LIGHT REQUIRED. When
any building or structure is being moved across or through any
street or alley, a warning light must be in operation at each
corner of such building or structure, from sunset to sunrise.

5-0309. EQUIPMENT IN STREET - LIGHTS REQUIRED. All ropes,
blocks, winches, windlasses, or other equipment used in the moving
of said building or structure must, when obstructing the free use
of a street or alley, be protected by suitable warning lights from
sunset to sunrise.

5-3-3



SECTIONS:

CHAPTER 5-04

FLOOD DAMAGE PREVENTION
Source: Ord. 188-06, Sec. 1 (20006)

5-0401. Statutory Authorization.

5-0402. Findings of Fact.

5-0403. Statement of Purpose.

5-0404. Methods of Reducing Flood Losses.

5-0405. Adoption of Flood Proofing Code.

5-0406. Definitions.

5-0407. Land to Which This Ordinance Applies.

5-0408. Basis for Establishing the Areas of Special Flood

Hazard.

5-0409. Compliance.

5-0410. Abrogation and Greater Restrictions.
5-0411. 1Interpretation.

5-0412. Warning and Disclaimer of Liability.
5-0413. Establishment of Development Permit.
5-0414. Designation of the Building Administrator.
5-0415. Duties and Responsibilities of the Building

Administrator.

5-0416. Variance Procedure.

5-0417. Provisions for Flood Hazard Reduction -- General
Standards.

5-0418. Provisions for Flood Hazard Reduction -- Specific
Standards.

5-0419. Floodways.
5-0420. Validity.
5-0421. Penalty.

5-0401. STATUTORY AUTHORIZATION. The Legislature of the
State of North Dakota has in Chapter 40-47 of the North Dakota
Century Code delegated the responsibility to local governmental
units to adopt regulations designed to promote the public health,
safety, and general welfare of its citizenry. Therefore, the City
Council of the City of Mapleton, North Dakota does ordain as

follows:

5-0402. FINDINGS OF FACT.

1.

The flood hazard areas of Mapleton are subject to
periodic inundation which results in loss of life and
property, health and safety hazards, disruption of
commerce and governmental services, extraordinary public
expenditures for flood protection and relief, and
impairment of the tax base, all of which adversely affect
the public health, safety and general welfare.

5-4-1



These flood losses are caused by the cumulative effect of
obstructions in areas of special flood hazards which
increase flood heights and wvelocities, and when
inadequately anchored, damage uses in other areas. Uses
that are inadequately floodproofed, elevated or otherwise
protected from flood damage also contribute to the flood
loss.

5-0403. STATEMENT OF PURPOSE. It is the purpose of this
ordinance to promote the public health, safety, and general

welfare,

and to minimize public and private losses due to flood

conditions in specific areas by provisions designed:

1.

2.

To protect human life and health;

To minimize expenditure of public money for costly flood
control projects;

To minimize the need for rescue and relief efforts
associated with flooding and generally undertaken at the
expense of the general public;

To minimize prolonged business interruptions;

To minimize damage to public facilities and utilities
such as water and gas mains, electric, telephone and
sewer lines, streets and bridges located in areas of
special flood hazard;

To help maintain a stable tax base by providing for the
second use and development of areas of special flood
hazard so as to minimize future flood blight areas;

To insure that potential buyers are notified that
property is in an area of special flood hazard; and

To ensure that those who occupy the areas of special
flood hazard assume responsibility for their actions.

5-0404. METHODS OF REDUCING FLOOD LOSSES. In order to
accomplish its purposes, this ordinance includes methods and
provisions for:

1.

Restricting or prohibiting uses which are dangerous to
health, safety, and property due to water or erosion
hazards, or which result in damaging increases in erosion
or in flood heights or velocities;

Requiring that uses vulnerable to floods, including

facilities which serve such uses, be protected against
flood damage at the time of initial construction;

5-4-2



3. Controlling filling, grading, dredging, and other
development which may increase flood damage;

4. Controlling the alteration of natural flood plains,
stream channels, and natural protective barriers, which
help accommodate or channel flood waters; and

5. Preventing or regulating the construction of flood
barriers which will unnaturally divert flood waters or
which may increase flood hazards in other areas.

5-0405. ADOPTION OF FLOOD PROOFING CODE. There is hereby
adopted by the City Council of the City of Mapleton for the purpose
of providing minimum standards to safeguard life or limb, health,
property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the
construction, quality of materials, use and occupancy, location and
maintenance of all buildings and structures within the "Floodway
and the Special Flood Hazard Area" and certain equipment
specifically regulated herein, including permits and penalties,
that certain code known as the Flood Proofing Code prepared by
Moore Engineering, Inc., of West Fargo, North Dakota, in June 1981,
of which not less than three (3) copies have been and now are filed
in the office of the City Auditor of the City of Mapleton, and the
same are hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set out at
length herein, and from the date on which this title shall take
effect, the provisions thereof shall be controlling in the
construction of all buildings and structures therein contained
within the jurisdiction of the City of Mapleton.

5-0406. DEFINITIONS. Unless specifically defined below,
words or phrases used in this ordinance shall be interpreted so as
to give them the meaning they have in common usage and to give this
ordinance its most reasonable application.

1. "Appeal" means a request for a review of the Building
Administrator's interpretation of any provisions of this
ordinance or a request for a variance.

2. "Area of special flood hazard" means the land in the
flood plain within a community subject to a one percent
or greater chance of flooding in any given year.

3. "Base flood" or “100-vear flood” means the flood having
a one percent chance of being equaled or exceeded in any
given year.

4. “Base Flood Elevation” (BFE) means the height of the base
flood or 100-year flood usually in feet above mean sea
level.

5-4-3



10.

11.

12.

13.

“Basement” means any area of the building having its
floor subgrade (below ground level) on all sides.

“Best Available Data” (BAD) means water elevation
information from any source used to estimate or determine
a base flood elevation (i.e. high water mark).

“Convevance or hydraulic conveyance” means a geometric
characteristic of a river or watercourse at a given point
that determines the flow-carrying capacity at that point.

"Development”" means any man-made change to improved or
unimproved real estate, including but not limited to
buildings or other structures, mining, dredging, filling,
grading, paving, excavation or drilling operations
located within the area of special flood hazard.

"Flood" or "flooding" means a general and temporary
condition of partial or complete inundation of normally
dry land areas from:

a. The overflow of inland waters and/or

b. The unusual and rapid accumulation or
runoff of surface waters from any source.

"Flood Insurance Rate Map" (FIRM) means the official map
on which the Federal Emergency Management Agency has
delineated both the areas of special flood hazards and
the risk premium zones applicable to the community.

"Flood Insurance Study" means the official report
provided by the Federal Emergency Management Agency that
includes flood profiles, the Flood Insurance Rate Map,
the water surface elevation of the base flood, and
identifies the floodway.

“Floodproofing” (Dry) means protection provided a
structure, together with attendant utilities and sanitary
facilities, which is watertight two feet above the base
flood elevation with walls that are substantially
impermeable to the passage of water.

"Floodproofing" means any combination of structural and
non-structural additions, changes or adjustments to
properties and structures which reduce or eliminate flood
damage to lands, water and sanitary facilities,
structures and contents of buildings.

14. "Floodproofing Code" means the Flood Proofing Code
of the City of West Fargo, ©North Dakota,

5-4-4



15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

hereinbefore referred to and adopted in Section 5-
0405.

"Floodway" or “requlatory floodway” means the channel of
a river or other watercourse and the adjacent land areas
that must be reserved in order to discharge the base
flood without cumulatively increasing the water surface
elevation more than a maximum of one foot.

"Lowest floor" means the lowest level of the lowest
enclosed area (including basement). An unfinished or
flood resistant enclosure, usable solely for parking of
vehicles, building access or storage, in an area other
than a basement area, 1is not considered a building’s
lowest floor, provided that such enclosure is not built
so as to render the structure in wviolation of the
applicable floodproofing design requirements of this
ordinance.

"Manufactured home"™ means a structure that is
transportable in one or more sections, built on a
permanent chassis, and designed to be used with or
without a permanent foundation when connected to the
required utilities. It includes recreational vehicles or
travel trailers placed on a site for more than 180
consecutive days.

"Manufactured home park or subdivision" means a parcel
(or contiguous parcels) of land divided into two or more
manufactured home lots for rent or sale.

"New construction" means structures for which the "start
of construction" commenced on or after the effective date
of this ordinance.

“Reasonably safe from flooding” means base flood waters
will not inundate the land or damage structures to be
removed from the special flood hazard area, and that any
subsurface waters related to the base flood will not
damage existing or proposed buildings.

“Recreational vehicle” means a vehicle which is:

a. built on a single chassis;

b. 400 square feet or less when measured at the
largest horizontal projection;

C. designed to be self-propelled or permanently
towable by a light duty truck;

5-4-5



22.

23.

24.

25.

d. designed primarily not for use as a permanent
dwelling but as a temporary living quarters for
recreational camping, travel, or seasonal use;
including, but not limited to:

e. travel trailers, trailers on wheels, park-model
trailers, and other similar vehicles.

"Start of construction”" includes substantial improvement,
and means the date the building permit was issued,
provided the actual start of construction, repair,
reconstruction, placement, or other improvement was
within 180 days of the permit date. The actual start
means the first placement of permanent construction of a
structure on a site, such as the pouring of slab or
footings, the installation of piles, the construction of
columns, or any work beyond the stage of excavation or
the placement of a manufactured home on a foundation.
Permanent construction does not include land preparation,
such as clearing, grading and filling; nor does it
include the installation of streets and/or walkways; nor
does it include excavation for a basement, footings,
piers, or foundations or the erection of temporary forms;
nor does it include the installation on the property of
accessory buildings, such as garages or sheds not
occupied as dwelling units or not part of the main
structure.

"Structure" means a walled and roofed building,
manufactured home or 1liquid storage tank that is
principally above ground.

“Substantial damage” means damage of any origin sustained

by a structure whereby the cost of restoring the building
to its pre-damaged condition would equal or exceed 50
percent of the market value of the structure before the
damage occurred.

"Substantial improvement" means any repair,
reconstruction, or improvement of a structure, the cost
of which equals or exceeds 50 percent of the market value
of the structure either:

a. Before the improvement or repair is started,
or
b. If the structure has been damaged and is

being restored before the damage occurred.
For the purposes of this definition
"substantial improvement" is considered to
occur when the first alteration of any wall,
ceiling, floor, or other structural part of
the building commences, whether or not that

5-4-6



alteration affects the external dimensions of
the structure.

The term does not, however, include either:

a. Any project for improvement of a structure to
comply with existing state or local health,
sanitary, or safety code specifications which
are solely necessary to assure safe living
conditions, or

b. Any alteration of a structure listed on
the National Register of Historic Places
or a State Inventory of Historic Places.

26. "Variance" means a grant of relief from the requirements
of this ordinance which permits construction in a manner
that would otherwise be prohibited by this ordinance.

5-0407. LANDS TO WHICH THIS ORDINANCE APPLIES. This
ordinance shall apply to all areas of special flood hazards within
the jurisdiction of Mapleton.

5-0408. BASIS FOR ESTABLISHING THE AREAS OF SPECIAL FLOOD
HAZARD. The areas of special flood hazard identified by the
Federal Emergency Management Agency in a scientific and engineering
report entitled “Flood Insurance Study, City of Mapleton, North
Dakota, dated February 2, 2002,” with an accompanying "Flood
Insurance Rate Map" is hereby adopted by reference and declared to
be a part of this ordinance. The Flood Insurance Study is on file
at the City Hall in Mapleton.

5-0409. COMPLIANCE. No structure or land shall hereafter be
constructed, located, extended, converted, or altered without full
compliance with the terms of this ordinance and other applicable
regulations.

5-0410. GREATER RESTRICTIONS. This ordinance is not intended
to repeal, remedy, or impair any existing easements, covenants, or
deeded restrictions. However, where this ordinance and another
ordinance, easement, covenant, or deed restriction conflict or
overlap, whichever imposes the more stringent restrictions shall
prevail.

5-0411. INTERPRETATION. In the interpretation and
application of this ordinance, all provisions shall be:

1. Considered as minimum requirements;
2. Liberally construed in favor of the governing body; and

3. Deemed neither to limit nor repeal any other powers
granted under state statutes.

5-4-7



5-0412. WARNING AND DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY. The degree of
flood protection required by this ordinance 1is considered
reasonable for regulatory purposes and is based on scientific and
engineering considerations. Larger floods can and will occur on
rare occasions. Flood heights may be increased by man-made or
natural causes. This ordinance does not imply that land outside
the areas of special flood hazards or uses permitted within such
areas will be free from flooding or flood damages. This ordinance
shall not create liability on the part of the City of Mapleton, any
officer or employee thereof, or the Federal Emergency Management
Agency, for any flood damages that may result from reliance on this
ordinance or any administrative decision lawfully made thereunder.

5-0413. ESTABLISHMENT OF DEVELOPMENT PERMIT. A development
permit shall be obtained before construction or development begins
within any area of special flood hazard established in
Section 5-0408. Application for a development permit shall be made
on forms furnished by the City Council of Mapleton and may include,
but not be limited to: plans in duplicate drawn to scale showing
the nature, location, dimensions, and elevations of the area in
question; existing or proposed structures, fill storage materials,
drainage facilities; and the location of the foregoing.
Specifically, the following information is required:

1. Elevation in relation to mean sea level, of the lowest
floor of all structures.

2. Elevation in relation to mean sea level to which any
structure has been floodproofed.

3. Certification by a registered professional engineer or
architect that the floodproofing methods for any non-
residential structure must Dbeet the floodproofing
criteria in Section 5-0418.B.

4. Description of the extent to which any watercourse will
be altered or relocated as a result of proposed
development.

5-0414. DESIGNATION OF THE BUILDING ADMINISTRATOR. The
Building Administrator is hereby appointed to administer and
implement this ordinance by granting or denying development permit
applications in accordance with its provisions.

5-0415. DUTIES AND RESPONSIBILITIES OF THE BUILDING

ADMINISTRATOR. Duties of the Building Administrator shall include,
but not be limited to:

5-4-8



D.

Permit Review

1. Review all development permits to determine that
the permit requirements of this ordinance have been
satisfied.

2. Review all development permits to determine that
all necessary permits have been obtained from those
federal, state or local governmental agencies from
which prior approval is required.

3. Review all development permits to determine if the
proposed development is located in the floodway.
If located in the floodway, assure that the
encroachment provisions of Section 5-0419(1) are
met.

Use of Other Base Flood Data

When base flood elevation data has not been provided in
accordance with Section 5-0408, BASIS FOR ESTABLISHING
THE AREAS OF SPECIAL FLOOD HAZARD, the Building
Administrator shall obtain, review, and reasonably
utilize any base flood elevation and floodway data
available from a federal, state or other source, as
criteria for requiring that new construction, substantial
improvements or other development in the floodplain are
administered in accordance with in order to administer
Section 5-0418 SPECIFIC STANDARDS.

Information to be Obtained and Maintained

1. Obtain and record the actual elevation (in relation
to mean sea level) of the lowest floor (including
basement) of all new or substantially improved
structures, and whether or not the structure
contains a basement.

2. For all new or substantially improved floodproofed
Structures:
a. Obtain and record the actual elevation (in

relation to mean sea level) to which the
structure has been floodproofed, and

b. Maintain the floodproofing certifications
required in Section 5-0413.3.

3. Maintain for public inspection all records
pertaining to the provision of this ordinance.

Alteration of Watercourses

5-4-9



1. Notify adjacent communities and the North Dakota
State Engineer prior to any alteration or
relocation of a watercourse, and submit evidence of
such notification to the Federal Emergency
Management Agency.

2. Require that maintenance is provided within the
altered or relocated portion of said watercourse so
that the flood carrying capacity is not diminished.

E. Interpretation of Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM)
Boundaries

Make interpretation where needed as to the exact location
of the boundaries of the areas of special flood hazards
(for example, where there appears to be a conflict
between a mapped boundary and actual field conditions).
The person contesting the location of the boundary shall
be given a reasonable opportunity to appeal the
interpretation as provided in Section 5-0416.

5-0416. VARIANCE PROCEDURE.
A. Appeal Board

1. The City Council as established by the City of
Mapleton shall hear and decide appeals and requests
for wvariances from the requirements of this
ordinance.

2. The Council shall hear and decide appeals when it
is alleged there is an error in any requirements,
decision, or determination made by the Building
Administrator or City Engineer in the enforcement
or administration of this ordinance.

3. Those aggrieved by the decision of the City
Council, or any taxpayer, may appeal such decision
to the District Court, as provided in.

4. In passing upon such applications, the City Council
shall consider all technical evaluations, all
relevant factors, standards specified in other
sections of this ordinance, and:

a. The danger that materials may be swept onto
other lands to the injury of others;

b. The danger to 1life and property due to
flooding or erosion damage;

5-4-10



c. The susceptibility of the proposed facility
and 1its contents to flood damage and the
effect of such damage on the individual owner;

d. The importance of the services provided by the
proposed facility to the community;

e. The necessity to the facility of a waterfront
location, where applicable;

f. The availability of alternative locations, for
the proposed use which are not subject to
flooding or erosion damage;

g. The compatibility of the proposed use with
existing and anticipated development;

h. The relationship of the proposed use to the
comprehensive plan and flood plain management
program for that area;

i. The safety of access to the property in times
of flood for ordinary and emergency vehicles;

J. The expected heights, velocity, duration, rate
of rise, and sediment transport of the flood
waters and the effects of wave action, if
applicable, expected at the site; and

k. The costs of providing governmental services
during and after flood conditions, including
maintenance and repair of public utilities and
facilities such as sewer, gas, electrical, and
water systems, and streets and bridges.

Generally, variances may be issued for new
construction and substantial improvements to be
erected on a lot of one-half acre or less in size
contiguous to and surrounded by lots with existing
structures constructed below the base flood level,
providing items a-k of Section 5-0416(A) (4) have
been fully considered. As the lot size increases
beyond the one-half acre, the technical
justification required for issuing the wvariance
increases.

Upon consideration of the factors of
Section 5-0416(A) (4) and the purposes of this
ordinance, the City Council may attach such
conditions to the granting of wvariances as it

5-4-11



deems necessary to further the purposes of this
ordinance.

The Building Administrator shall maintain the
records of all appeal actions and report any
variances to the Federal Emergency Management
Agency upon request.

B. Conditions for Variances

5-0417.

STANDARDS.

Variances may be issued for the reconstruction,
rehabilitation or restoration of structures listed
on the National Register of Historic Places or the
State Inventory of Historic Places, without regard
to the procedures set forth in the remainder of
this section.

Variances shall not be issued within any designated
floodway if any increase in flood levels during the
base flood discharge would result.

Variances shall only be issued upon a determination
that the wvariance 1is the minimum necessary,
considering the flood hazard, to afford relief.

Variances shall only be issued upon:

a. A showing of good and sufficient cause;

b. A determination that failure to grant the
variance would result in exceptional hardship
to the applicant; and

C. A determination that the granting of a
variance will not result 1in increased
flood heights, additional threats to public
safety, cause fraud on or victimization of the
public as identified in Section 5-0416(A) (4),
or conflict with existing 1local laws or
ordinances.

Any applicant to whom a variance is granted shall
be given written notice that the structure will be
permitted to be built with a lowest floor elevation
below the base flood elevation and that the cost of
flood insurance will be commensurate with the
increased risk resulting from the reduced lowest
floor elevation.

PROVISIONS FOR FLOOD HAZARD REDUCTION -- GENERAL

In all areas of special flood hazards the following

standards are required:

5-4-12



C.

Anchoring

1.

All new construction and substantial improvements
(including additions) shall be anchored to prevent
flotation, collapse or lateral movement of the
Structure.

All manufactured homes must be elevated or anchored
to resist flotation, collapse or lateral movement
and capable of resisting the hydrostatic and
hydrodynamic loads. Methods of anchoring
may 1include, but are not 1limited to, wuse of
over-the-top or frame ties to ground anchors. This
requirement is in addition to applicable state and
local anchoring reguirements for resisting wind
forces.

Construction Materials and Methods

1. All new construction and substantial
improvements shall be constructed with
materials and utility equipment resistant to
flood damage.

2. All new construction and substantial
improvements shall be constructed wusing
methods and practices that minimize flood
damage.

3. All new construction and substantial
improvements shall be constructed with
electrical, heating, ventilation, plumbing,
and air conditioning equipment and other
service facilities that are designed and/or
located so as to prevent water from entering
or accumulating within the components during
conditions of flooding.

Utilities

1.

All new and replacement water supply systems shall
be designed to minimize or eliminate infiltration
of flood waters into the system;

New and replacement sanitary sewage systems shall
be designed to minimize or eliminate infiltration
of flood waters into the systems and discharge from
the systems into flood waters; and

On-site waste disposal systems shall be located to

avoid impairment to them or contamination from them
during flooding.

5-4-13



D. Subdivision Proposals

1. All subdivision proposals shall be consistent with
the need to minimize flood damage;

2. All subdivision proposals shall have public
utilities and facilities such as sewer, gas,
electrical, and water systems located and
constructed to minimize flood damage;

3. All subdivision proposals shall have adequate
drainage provided to reduce exposure to flood
damage; and

4. Base flood elevation data shall be provided for
subdivision proposals and other proposed
development which contain at least 50 lots or
5 acres (whichever is less).

5-0418. PROVISIONS FOR FLOOD HAZARD REDUCTION--SPECIFIC
STANDARDS. 1In all areas of special flood hazards where base flood
elevation data has been provided as set in Section 5-0408 BASIS FOR
ESTABLISHING THE AREAS OF SPECIAL FLOOD HAZARD or
Section 5-0415(B), Use of Other Base Flood Data, the following
provisions are required:

A. Residential Construction

1. New construction and substantial improvement of any
residential structure shall:

a. Conform to structural and technical provisions
set forth in the Mapleton Floodproofing Code
approved by the Federal Emergency Management
Agency and adopted by the City of Mapleton.

b. Be designed so that the first floor is at
least one foot above the base flood level.
Any basement area, together with attendant
utilities and sanitary facilities, below that
level shall be designed so that the structure
is watertight without human intervention
(i.e., the base or sill of all external
openings such as windows and doors must Dbe
one foot above the 100 year base flood
elevation) . Basement walls shall be built
with the capability to resist hydrostatic and
hydrodynamic loads and the effects of
buoyancy resulting from the 100-year
frequency flood and shall be designed so that

5-4-14



minimal structural damage will occur if this
design is exceeded.

C. Basements constructed in accordance with these
regulations shall not be used for sleeping
purposes.

d. Be certified by a registered professional

engineer that the floodproofing measures used
in the structure satisfy the floodproofing
standards.

e. The Building Administrator shall certify that
the structure has been built in accordance
with the floodproofing code approved by the
Federal Emergency Management Agency.

Nonresidential Construction

New construction and substantial improvement of any
commercial, industrial or other nonresidential structure
shall either have the lowest floor, including basement,
elevated one foot above the level of the base flood
elevation; or, together with attendant utility and
sanitary facilities, shall:

1. Be floodproofed so that one foot above the base
flood level the structure is watertight with walls
substantially impermeable to the passage of water;

2. Have structural components capable of resisting
hydrostatic and hydrodynamic loads and effects of
buoyancy; and

3. Be certified by a registered professional engineer
or architect that the standards of this subsection
are satisfied. Such certifications shall be
provided to the official as set forth in Section
5-0415.C.2

Manufactured Homes

1. Manufactured homes shall be anchored in accordance
with Section 5-0417 (A) .

2. All manufactured homes to be placed or
substantially improved shall Dbe elevated on a
permanent foundation such that the lowest floor of
the manufactured home is ONE FOOT above the base
flood elevation and is securely anchored to an
adequately anchored foundation system.

5-4-15



5-0419. FLOODWAYS. Located within areas of special flood
hazard established in Section 5-0408 are areas designated as
floodways. Since the floodway is an extremely hazardous area due
to the velocity of flood waters which carry debris, potential
projectiles, and erosion potential, the following provisions apply:

1. Prohibit encroachments, including fill, new construction,
substantial improvements, and other development unless
certification by a registered professional engineer or
architect is provided demonstrating that encroachments
shall not result in any increase in flood levels during
the occurrence of the base flood discharge.

2. If Section 5-0419 (1) is satisfied, all new construction
and substantial improvements shall comply with all
applicable flood hazard reduction provisions of
Sections 5-0417, 5-0418 and 5-0419.

5-0420. VALIDITY. If any section, clause, paragraph,
provision, or portion of these regulations shall be held invalid or
unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction, such
holding shall not affect any other section, clause, paragraph,
provision, or portion of these regulations.

5-0421. PENALTY. Any person violating any section of this
chapter shall be guilty of an infraction and shall be subject to
the penalties set forth in Section 1-0211. Each day such violation
continues shall be considered a separate offense.

5-4-16



CHAPTER 5-05
MINIMUM HOUSING STANDARDS
SECTIONS:
5-0501. Adoption of Housing Code.

5-0502. Exceptions to Housing Code.
5-0503. Penalty.

5-0501. ADOPTION OF HOUSING CODE. There is hereby adopted by
reference by the City Council, for the purpose of prescribing
regulations governing standards, relative to housing in the City of
Mapleton, that certain code known as the Uniform Housing Code,
recommended and compiled by the International Conference of
Building Officials, being particularly the 1988 edition thereof, as
the same are now established in said code, a copy of which is on
file in the office of the Auditor for the City of Mapleton, with
the exception of the sections hereinafter set forth affecting local
conditions of the City of Mapleton, which sections shall be
substituted for and in lieu of like sections or paragraphs in said
Uniform Housing Code; the City Council of said City of Mapleton, by
this section hereby approves and adopts such rules and regulations,
so modified, for the use and application within the city limits of
Mapleton, North Dakota. Provided, that any amendments of the 1988
edition of the Code may be adopted by the City by resolution.

5-0502. EXCEPTIONS TO HOUSING CODE. When any provisions of
the Uniform Housing Code are in conflict with the Building Code,
Mechanical Code, zoning provisions or other ordinances of the City
of Mapleton, those other ordinances shall prevail and supersede the
provisions of the Uniform Housing Code.

5-0503. PENALTY. Any person violating any section of this
chapter shall upon conviction be guilty of an infraction and shall
be subject to the penalties set forth in Section 1-0211. Each day
such violation continues shall be considered a separate offense.

Source: Ord. 216-13, Sec. 2 (2015)

5-5-1



CHAPTER 5-06

INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE
(Source: Ord. 209-11, Sec. 1)

SECTIONS:
5-0601. Adoption of International Property Maintenance
Code.
5-0602. Amendment to International Property Maintenance
Code. (Source: Ord. 241-18)

5-0603. Penalty.
5-0604. Appeals.

5-0601. ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE.
There is hereby adopted by reference by the City Council, for the
purpose of prescribing regulations governing standards, relative to
housing in the City of Mapleton, that certain code known as the
International Property Maintenance Code, recommended and compiled
by the International Code Council, being particularly the 2015
edition thereof, as the same are now established in said code, a
copy of which is on file in the office of the Building
Administrator for the City of Mapleton, with the exception of the
sections hereinafter set forth affecting local conditions of the
City of Mapleton, which sections shall be substituted for and in
lieu of like sections or paragraphs in said International Property
Maintenance Code; the City Council of said City of Mapleton, by
this section hereby approves and adopts such rules and regulations,
so modified, for the use and application within the city limits of
Mapleton, North Dakota. Provided, that any amendments of the 2015
edition of the Code may be adopted by the City by resolution.

(Source: Ord. 241-18)

5-0602. AMENDMENT TO INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE.
The International Property Maintenance Code, as adopted 1in
Section 5-0601 is hereby changed and amended as follows:

SECTION 101.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the
Property Maintenance Code of TNAMEOFJORISBTICTIONT the

City of Mapleton, hereinafter to as “this code.”

SECTION 102.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:
102.3 Application of other codes. Repairs, additions or

alterations to a structure, or changes of occupancy,
shall be done in accordance with the procedures and

5-6-1



+ o il 7 Yl Va NN e = o
TT1rc Couc, Tiicocrlliiacrollarlr rucLt Tdo Coucr, ITirccocrilacroirart

DL I~ ) 1 yal =l T = = o 1 n ; = o 1 yal =l

ST CIlIIiAdll 10T dLl L/UL,LC, LITCCT L IIAatC L UIIAd L INC O L UTIIC L AL puuc,
International Plumbing Code and the NFPA 70 all
applicable ordinances adopted by the City of Mapleton.

NO C ooc Td oT O SIS O

Code~
SECTION 103.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R103.4 Liability. The building official, member of the
board of appeals or employee charged with the enforcement
of this code, while acting for the jurisdiction in good
faith and without malice in the discharge of the duties
required by this code or other pertinent law or
ordinance, shall not thereby be vailly Or pLLmiually
rendered liable personally and is hereby relieved from
personal liability for any damage accruing to persons or
property as a result of any act or by reason of an act or
omission in the discharge of official duties. Any suit
instituted against an officer or employee because of an
act or omission performed by that officer or employee in
the lawful discharge of duties and under the provisions
of this code shall be afforded all the protection
provided by the city’s insurance pool and immunities and
defenses provided by other applicable state and federal
laws and shall be defended by legal representative of the
Jjurisdiction until the final termination of the
proceedings. The building official or any subordinate
shall not be liable for cost in any action, suit or
proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the
provisions of this code.

This code shall not be construed to relieve from or
lessen the responsibility of any person owning,
operating, or controlling any building or structure for
any damages to persons or property caused by defects, nor
shall the code enforcement agency or the city be held as
assuming any such liability by reason of the inspection
authorized by this code or anv permits or certificates
issued under this code.

SECTION 103.4.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 103.5 is added to read as follows:

103.5 Fees. The fees for activities and services
performed by the department in carrying out its

5-6-2



responsibilities under this code shall be as indicated in
the following schedule:

A Initial Inspection - No charge

B. First Re—-inspection - No charge

C Second Re-inspection - As to the second
re-inspection, a fee of $100

D. Third Re-inspection - as to the third
re—inspection, a fee of $100

E. Fourth and continuing Re-inspection - as to the
fourth and any subsequent re-inspection, a fee of
5100

SECTION 111 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 112.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

112.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue
any work after been served with a stop work order, except
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove
a violation or unsafe condition, shall be Tiabie to—=
fiuc Uf llUt lbbb thcu [AI"&IUUI\\TT] dUlchLD UL IMMTOUOLT t}ldll

TAMOONTT—dottars subject to penalties prescribed by law.

SECTION 201.3 is hereby amended to add the following:

201.3 Terms defined in other codes. Where terms are not
defined in this code and are defined in the International
Building Code, International Existing Building Code,
International Fire Code, International Fuel Gas Code,
International Mechanical Code, International Plumbing
Code, International Residential Code, Tmtermeationat
Zormrtrmg—Ctode or NFPA 70, such terms shall have meanings
ascribed to them as in those codes.

Throughout this code, wherever reference is made to the
International Plumbing Code it shall mean the North
Dakota State Plumbing Code. Throughout this code,
wherever reference is made to the ICC Electrical Code it
shall mean the National Electrical Code together with the
North Dakota State Wiring Standards.

SECTION 302.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

302.4 Weeds. All premises and exterior property shall be
maintained free from weeds or plant growth trmrexcess—of
(_juJ_JI_DdJI_k,tJ'_ULL to—tIrsert hcight 1T J'_llL,].lCD) as per the Citv
of West Fargo Ordinances. All noxious weeds shall be
prohibited. Weeds shall be defined as all grasses, annual
plants and vegetation, other than trees or shrubs
provided; however, this term shall not include cultivated

5-6-3



flowers and gardens. Upon failure of the owner or agent
having charge of a property to cut and destroy weeds
after service of a notice of violation, they shall be
subject to prosecution in accordance with Section 106.3
and as prescribed by the authority having jurisdiction.
Upon failure to comply with the notice of violation, any
duly authorized employee of the Jjurisdiction or
contractor hired by the jurisdiction shall be authorized
to enter upon the property in wviolation and cut and
destroy the weeds growing thereon, and the costs of such
removal shall be paid by the owner or agent responsible
for the property.

SECTION 304.14 is hereby amended to read as follows:

304.14 Insect screens. During the period from TPAFET
April 1%t to TBAFET October 31°f, every door, window and
other outside opening required for ventilation of
habitable rooms, food preparation areas, food service
areas or any areas where products to be included or
utilized in food for human consumption are processed,
manufactured, packaged or stored shall be supplied with
approved tightly fitting screens of not less than 16 mesh
per inch (16 mesh per 25 mm), and every screen door used
for insect control shall have a self-closing device in
good working condition.

Exception: Screens shall not be required where
other approved means, such as air curtains or
insect repellent fans, are employed.

SECTION 602.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

602.2 Residential occupancies. Dwellings shall Dbe
provided with heating facilities capable of maintaining
a room temperature of 68°F (20°C) in all habitable rooms,
bathrooms and toilet rooms basedormrthewirter—outdoor
uCDJ.\jJ.l L,CllltJCJ_CLL,uJ_C J_UJ_ L,llC J_UL/CLJ_J_ L,_Y J_J.luJ_k,ClL,Cu J_J.l nb)b)cllle_

D of the International Plumbing Code. Cooking appliances
shall not be used to provide space heating to meet the
requirements of this section.

Exception: In areas where the average monthly
4 o . 1 o Wal:) (1O /v . :
LTITpT L aLULT EENS) dlUVET o U 7 L‘ L\ L 7Ty [=} T LT TITTCILT
— C O - L1 00 /) 1 17 1 : J_ : |
L,Clllj_JCJ_CiL,uJ_C UJ_ O J /L \1L0O ) olld L 1 U llldallltadalllTU.

SECTION 602.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:
602 .3 Heat supply. Every owner and operator of any

building who rents, leases or lets one or more dwelling
units or sleeping units on terms, either expressed or

5-6-4



implied, to furnish heat to the occupants thereof shall
supply heat during the period from—fPAFTET September 15%
to TBATET June 1°" to maintain a temperature of not less
than 68°F (20°C) in all habitable rooms, bathrooms, and
toilet rooms.

Exceptions:

1. When the outdoor temperature is below the
winter outdoor design temperature for the
locality, maintenance of the minimum room
temperature shall not Dbe required
provided that the heating system is
operating at its full design capacity~

funi) .. K. ] | .. . . =
I WIlITtT L " UUtLtUUU LI " UTs Tyl tTlipTl daturT 1LUL

) | 1o h) 17 h) . 1 e A .
L1IIT LTOUTCal1IUly oSlIdl 1T DT do LTIaarcatTu 11T

: o  onal Plumbi

I P |
avclildycT [MUulltilrty

-
. ] ggOE —]OE .

e of 65°F (18°C) shall be

Np
'_
Q
H
(
ol
Ul
=
q
H
(
T
q

SECTION 602.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

602.4 Occupiable work spaces. Indoor occupiable work
spaces shall be supplied with heat during the period from
TBATET September 15 to tBAFET June 1°%° to maintain a
minimum temperature of 65°F (18°C) during the period the
spaces are occupied.

Exceptions:

1. Processing, storage and operation areas that
require cooling or special temperature conditions.
2. Areas in which persons are primarily engaged in
vigorous physical activities.

SECTION 603.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

603.2 Removal of combustion products. All fuel-burning
equipment and appliances shall be connected to an
approved chimney or vent.

£ on 1 . . i 1

loo h] ] h] ] 1 e 1 N
willl1Cll adail<© 14T ltTU L1 OUL llvalltTcUu UOpTS Ll at LU,

5-0603. PENALTY. A violation of the regulations contained in
this chapter shall be deemed an offense and shall be punishable by
a fine of not to exceed Five Hundred Dollars ($500). Each day that

5-6-5



a violation is permitted to exist shall constitute a separate
offense. The provisions of Section 1-0211 shall also apply.

5-0604. Appeals. A person shall have the right to appeal a
decision of the Code Official to the Board of Appeals. The
Mapleton City Commission shall be the Board of Appeals. An appeal
in writing to the Code Official must be made within 20 days of the
decision of the Code Official. The Mapleton City Commission shall
hear the appeal within 30 days of the Code Official receiving
written notice of the appeal. The Commission may only reverse or
modify a decision of the Code Official by a vote of at least three
members of the Commission. If not all members of the Commission
are present at the hearing, the person appealing the decision may
request a postponement, which may extend the 30-day period to hold
such a hearing. An application for an appeal shall be based on a
claim that the true intent of the Code has been incorrectly
interpreted, the provisions of the Code do not fully apply, or an
equally good or better form of construction is proposed. The
commission shall have no authority to waive requirements of the
Code.

5-6-6



CHAPTER 5-07

INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE
(Source: Ord. 210-11, Sec. 1)

SECTIONS:
5-0701. Adoption of International Residential Code.
5-0702. Amendment to International Residential Code.

(Source: Ord. 234-18)
5-0703. Penalty.
5-0704. Fee for Copy of Relevant Code Provisions.
5-0705. Appeals.

5-0701. ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE. There is
hereby adopted by reference by the City Council, for the purpose of
prescribing regulations governing standards, relative to housing in
the City of Mapleton, that certain code known as the International
Residential Code, recommended and compiled by the International
Code Council, being particularly the 2015 edition thereof, as the
same are now established in said code, a copy of which is on file
in the office of the Building Administrator for the City of
Mapleton, with the exception of the sections hereinafter set forth
affecting local conditions of the City of Mapleton, which sections
shall be substituted for and in lieu of like sections or paragraphs
in said International Residential Code; the City Council of said
City of Mapleton, by this section hereby approves and adopts such
rules and regulations, so modified, for the use and application
within the city limits of Mapleton, North Dakota, as well as for
any area within the extraterritorial zoning jurisdiction of the
City. Provided, that any amendments of the 2015 edition of the
Code may be adopted by the City by resolution.

Source: Ord. 234-18

5-0702. AMENDMENT TO INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE. The
International Residential Code, as adopted in Section 5-0701 is
hereby changed and amended as follows:

SECTION R101.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the
Residential Code for One- and Two-family Dwellings of
TNAMEOFJFORISBTFCTFONT the City of Mapleton, and shall be
cited as such and will be referred to herein as “this
code.”

5-7-1



SECTION R104.8 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R104.8 General. The building official, member of the
board of appeals or employee charged with the enforcement
of this code. While acting for the jurisdiction in good
faith and without malice in the discharge of the duties
required by this code or other pertinent law or
ordinance, shall not thereby be bivilly Or k.,J_J._lllJl_lld.ll_y
rendered liable personally and is hereby relieved from
personal liability for any damage accruing to persons or
property as a result of any act or by reason of an act or
omission in the discharge of official duties. Any suit
instituted against an officer or emplovee because of an
act or omission performed by that officer or employee in
the lawful discharge of duties and under the provisions
of this code shall be afforded all the protection
provided by the city’s insurance pool and immunities and
defenses provided by other applicable state and federal
laws and shall be defended by legal representative of the
jurisdiction until the final termination of the
proceedings. The building official or any subordinate
shall not be liable for cost in any action, suit or
proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the
provisions of this code.

This code shall not be construed to relieve from or
lessen the responsibility of any person owning,
operating, or controlling any building or structure for
any damages to persons or property caused by defects, nor
shall the code enforcement agency or the city be held as
assuming any such liability by reason of the inspection
authorized by this code or any permits or certificates
issued under this code.

SECTION R104.8.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION R104.10.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION R105.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R105.2 Work exempt from permit. Exemptions
Building:

1. One-story detached accessory structures
used as tool and storage sheds,
playvhouses, and similar uses, provided
the floor area 1s not greater than
120 square feet (11 m,).

2. Fences not over + 8.5 feet 2134
2591 mm) high.

5-7-2



3. Retaining walls that are not

7. Prefabricated Sswimming pools that—=are

] i) la YW, . h] /L A \ 1
LTOS O Lliall = LITCTIITOS VO LU IILT) Uccpy.

10. Decks not exceeding 266 120 square feet
3 8-58—m>) in area, that are not more
than 36 7 inches A7F6Z—mm) above grade at
any point, are not attached to a dwelling
and do not serve the exit door required
by Section R311.4.

SECTION R105.3.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION R106.1.4 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION R108.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R108.3 Building permit valuations. Building permit
valuation shall include total value of the work for which
a permit is being issued, such as electrical, gas,
mechanical, plumbing equipment and other permanent
systems, including materials and labor. If, in the
opinion of the building official, the wvaluation is
underestimated on the application, the permit shall be
denied, unless the applicant can show detailed estimates
to meet the approval of the building official. Final
building permit valuation shall be set by the building
official.

SECTION R201.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R201.3 Terms defined in other codes. Where terms
are not defined in this code such terms shall have
meanings ascribed to them as in other code publications
of the International Code Council. Wherever the term
“International Plumbing Code” and/or “International
Private Sewage Disposal Code” is used in the
International Residential Code, it shall mean the North
Dakota State Plumbing Code. Wherever the term ‘ICC
Electrical Code’ is used in the International Residential
Code, it shall mean the National Electrical Code together
with the North Dakota State Wiring Standards. Wherever
reference is made to flood plain reguirements, it shall
mean the Mapleton Flood Damage Prevention Ordinance
together with the Mapleton Flood Proofing Code.

5-7-3



TABLE R301.2.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

WIND SPEED SUBJECT TO DAM AGE FROM
GROUND . SEISMIC
NOW Special | V- DESIGN
S Speed® | Topographic . borne . Frost line .
LOAD wing ) CATEGORY?® Weathering® Termite®
(mph) effects* o debris depth®
region
zone™
50 psf no no no Zone A Severe 4.5 feet none
WINTER ICE BARRIER Flood AIR MEAN
DESIGN UNDERLAYMENT HAZARDS | FREEZING | ANNUAL
TEM P REQUIRED g INDEX! TEMP’
-18 YES 1978 4000 41.5

SECTION R301.2.4 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

TABLE R302.1(1)

TABLE 302.1(1)

EXTERIOR WALLS

is hereby amended to read as follows:

MINIMUM FIRE

MINIMUM SEPARATION
EXTERIOR WALL ELEMENT FIRE-RESISTANCE RATING DISTANCE
Walls® Fire-resistance rated 1 hour - tested in accordance <& 3 feet
with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 with
exposure from both sides
Not fire-resistance 0 hours >5 3 feet
rated
Not allowed N/A < 2 feet

Projections

Fire-resistance rated

1 hour on the underside =°®

>2 feet to < &

3 feet
Not fire-resistance 0 hours 5 3 feet
rated
Not allowed N/A < 3 feet
Openings

25% Maximum of Wall Area 0 hours 3 feet

Unlimited 0 hours 5 feet

Comply with Section 304.2 < 3 feet

Penetrations All

None Required 3 feet

5-7-4




For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

N/A = Not Applicable.

a. Roof eave fire-resistance rating shall be permitted to be reduced to 0 hours on
the underside of the eave if fireblocking is provided from the all top plate to the
underside of the roof sheathing.

b. Roof eave fire-resistance rating shall be permitted to be reduced to 0 hours on
the underside of the eave provided that gable vent openings are not installed.

c. A common 2-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assembly is permitted for two or more

family dwellings where the common wall is on a property line provided such walls

do not contain plumbing or mechanical equipment, ducts or vents in the cavity of

the common wall. FElectrical installations shall be installed in accordance with
national Electrical Code together with the North Dakota State Wiring Standards.

Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with Section 302.4

SECTION R302.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R302.2 Townhouses. Common walls separating townhouses .

2. Where a fire sprinkler system in accordance
with Section P2904 is not provided, the common
wall shall Dbe not 1less than a 2-hour
fire-resistance-rated wall assembly or two 1-
hour-fire-resistance wall assemblies tested in
accordance with ASTM E 119 or UL 263

SECTION R302.5.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R302.5.1 Opening protection. Openings from a private
garage directly into a room used for sleeping purposes
shall not be permitted. Other openings between the garage
and residence shall be equipped with solid wood doors not
less than 13/8 inches (35 mm) in thickness, solid or
honeycomb- core steel doors not less than 13/8 inches (35
mm) thick;—or—26—minmutefire—rateddoors,—eguippedwith

d Dle k/lUDJI_J.l\j d.CVJ._L/C.
SECTION R303.4 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION R307.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R307.1 Space required. Fixtures shall be spaced
in accordance with FJ._L_juJ_C R307~ l, Fc T accordance with
the requirements of SectiomrP2765-F the North Dakota
State Plumbing code and per Figure R30701, with the
exception of the clearance in front of water closets and
bidets which shall be 24 inches.

SECTION R309.3 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

5-7-5



SECTION R310.2.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R310.2.2 Window sill height. Where a window is provided
as the emergency escape and rescue opening, it shall have
a sill height of not more than 44 inches (1118 mm) above
the floor; where the sill height is below grade, it shall
be provided with a window well in accordance with Section
R310.2.3. Sill height shall be measured from the finished

floor to the bottom of the clear opening.

Exception: Below grade emergency escape and rescue

windows may have a maximum sill height of 48

inches.

SECTION R310.2.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R310.2.3.1 Ladder and steps. Window wells with a vertical
depth greater than 44 inches (1118 mm) shall be equipped
with a permanently affixed ladder or steps usable with
the window in the fully open position+, or shall be

equipped with a permanently—-attached platform at least 30

inches by 16 inches. The maximum distance between the top

of the window well and a platform shall be 42 inches and

shall not impede the operation of the window. Ladders or
steps required by this section shall not be required to
comply with Sections R311.7 and R311.8. Ladders or rungs
shall have an inside width of not less than 12 inches
(305 mm), shall project not less than 3 inches (76 mm)
from the wall and shall be spaced not more than 18 inches
(457 mm) on center vertically for the full height of the

window well.

Exception: Terraced window wells with a maximum of

24 inches per vertical rise and minimum 12 inches

per horizontal projection on each level shall also

be allowed.

SECTION R311.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R311.3 Floors and landings at exterior doors. There shall
be a landing or floor on each side of each exterior door.
The width of each landing shall be not less than the door
served. Every landing shall have a dimension of not less
than 36 inches (914 mm) measured in the direction of
travel. The slope at exterior landings shall not exceed
1/4 unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (2 percent).

Exceptions:

1. Exterior balconies less than 60 square feet
(5.6 m2) and only accessible from a door are

5-7-6



permitted to have a landing less than 36
inches (914 mm) measured in the direction of
travel.

2. A landing is not required on the outside of
exterior doors other than the required egress
door, where a stairway with a total rise of
less than 30 inches (762 mm) is located on the
exterior side of the door, provided the door
does not swing over the stairway.

SECTION R311.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R311.3.1 Floor elevations at the required egress doors.
Landings or finished floors at the required egress door
shall not be more than 11/2 inches (38 mm) lower than the
top of the threshold.

Exception: The landing or floor on the exterior
side shall not be more than #4374 8 inches ++96—mm)r
below the top of the threshold provided the door
does not swing over the landing or floor.

Where exterior landings or floors serving the required
egress door are not at grade, they shall be provided with
access to grade by means of a ramp in accordance with
Section R311.8 or a stairway in accordance with Section
R311.7.

SECTION R311.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R311.3.2 Floor elevations for other exterior doors.
Doors other than the required egress door shall be
provided with landings or floors not more than 34
8 inches «fS56—mm) below the top of the threshold.

Exception: A top landing is not required where a
stairway ofrmot—more—thartworisers with a total
rise of not less than 30 inches (762 mm) is located
on the exterior side of the door, provided that the
door does not swing over the stairway.

SECTION R311.7.5.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R311.7.5.1 Risers. The riser height shall be not
more than % 8 inches F96mm). The riser shall

SECTION R311.7.5.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section R311.7.5.2 Treads. The tread depth shall be not

less than 8 8 inches {254 mm). The tread depth shall be
measured horizontally between the vertical planes of the

5-7-7



foremost projection of adjacent treads and at a right
angle to the tread’s leading edge. The greatest tread
depth within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the
smallest by more than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm).

Exception: Where a landing is not provided or
required by Section R311.3, R311.3.2 or R311.7.6,
the top tread of a stair serving exterior doors
other than the required exit door, and in-swinging
doors opening into an attached garage, shall be
permitted to exceed the smallest tread by more than

3/8 inch (9.5 mm). Such a tread shall be at least
18 inches (457 mm) measured in the direction of
travel.

SECTION R311.7.5.2.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R311.7.5.2.1 Winder treads. Winder treads shall have a
minimum tread depth of 6 9 inches A254—mmr measured
between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of
adjacent treads at the intersections with the walkline.
Winter treads shall have a read depth of

SECTION R311.7.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R311.7.6 Landings for stairways. There shall be
a floor or landing at the top and bottom of each
stairway. The width perpendicular to the direction of
travel shall be not less than the width of the flight
served. Landings of shapes other than sqguare or
rectangular shall be permitted provided that the depth at
the walk line and the total area is not less than that of
a quarter circle with a radius equal to the required
landing width. Where the stairway has a straight run, the
depth in the direction of travel shall be not less than
36 inches (914 mm).

Exception:

1. A floor or landing is not required at the
top of an interior flight of stairs,
including stairs in an enclosed garage,
provided a door does not swing over the
stairs.

2. A landing is not required at the top of
an exterior flight of stairs with a total
rise of less than 30 inches, provided the
door does not swing over the stairway.

5-7-8



SECTION R312.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R312.1.1 Where Required. Guards shall be located along
open-sided walking surfaces, trrctudirng stairs, ramps and
landings that are located more than 30 inches (762 mm)

\Y )
of—the—oper——=ide- Insect screening shall not be
considered as a guard.

SECTION R313.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems. An
automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be
installed in townhouses where the townhouses are located
on a private street or private fire department access
read that is required to greater than 150 feet in length
as required by Section 503 of the International Fire
Code.

SECTION R313.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R313.1.1 Design and installation. Automatic residential
fire sprinkler systems for townhouses shall be designed
and installed in accordance with SectiomrP25964—or NFPA

13D, NFPA 13R or NFPA 13.

SECTION R313.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION R313.2.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION R314.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R314.3 Location. Smoke alarms shall be installed in
the following locations:

1. In each sleeping room.

5. In dwelling units where the ceiling height of a
room open to the hallway serving the bedrooms
exceeds that of the hallway by 24 inches (610 mm)
or more, smoke alarms shall be installed in the
hallway and the adjacent room.

SECTION R322 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION R326 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION R401.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R401.1 Application. The provisions of this chapter shall
control the design and construction of the foundation and

5-7-9



foundation spaces for all buildings. In addition to the
provisions of this chapter, the design and construction
of foundations in flood hazard areas as—estabtishedDy
FabteR3I6GT-2FtF) shall meet the provisions of SectiormrR322
the Mapleton Flood Proofing Code (Section 5-04) and any
other applicable reguirements of the City of Mapleton.
Wood foundations shall be designed and installed in

accordance with AWC PWF.

Exception: The provisions of this chapter shall be
permitted . .

SECTION R401.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R401.3 Drainage. Surface drainage shall be diverted to a
storm sewer conveyance or other approved point of
collection that does not create a hazard. Lots shall be
graded to drain surface water away from foundation walls.

fauh) 1 h) 13 b . . = . h) ([ DD \ LI, P
e ygradadc osliadal b Ladal b 4d lllLITIINUIIT OO LTSS UL IJZIUIT) WL UILTLII

tHre—first—36—feet—~(3648mm—
. : ] ; 15 1] 1 ]

1 . ul 1 . ) — . Val . 1 ([ D \ N
plrystccal " badril Il s PpLUITTOULU O LITCIITS 1 J LITILILLT) UL
W i | ) . 10 = . L A0 A Q) \ | . 1
lLdLl L WL CLCIILII LU LTl \oUR Ol ) UL adlllos UL oWd 1T O

h) 13 h) e . J 1 . W
olldl 1l DT CUIISLLULLTU LU TlIoULT ULldllldycT adawdady L LUI
) A A T : ey L 1N A
LIIT SLLUCLULT. LIPS L vV IOUS oUL L4dLTs WLIULUIILID LU LTTUL
Vo WalWV. We) \ ey Al h] i P I £ It o 1 13 h]
\oUa 0O LILL) UL LIIT DULLULIIY LOUIIUagtU LUILL olld L L JOAS)

ul ] - . Wad 2 . = .
o LUPTU [=} T L IT LITUILT UL Z pTELTTIlt awdady L L UIIl CLIIT

SECTION R403.1.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R403.1.4.1 Frost protection. Except where
otherwise protected from frost, foundation walls, piers and
other permanent supports of buildings and structures shall be
protected from frost by one or more of the following methods:

1. Extended below the frost line . .
Exceptions:

1. Protection of freestanding accessory

structures with—amr—area—of—6606 sSguare

feet—(56—m°) or less of light framed

construction anmt—amTreave hcight of—316

feet (3048 uuu) or—tess shall not be
required.
2. Protection of freestanding accessory

structures with an area of 400 square
feet (37 m?) or 1less, of other than
light-framed construction;—witlhr—armr—eave

5-7-10



retghtof+6feet {3648 mm—ortess shall

not be required.

3. Decks rrot DutJtJUJ_th b_y [} dwclliug need
not be provided with footings that extend
below the frost line.

Footings shall not bear on frozen soil unless the
frozen condition is permanent.

SECTION R404.1.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R404.1.3.2 Reinforcement for foundation walls. Concrete
foundation walls shall be laterally supported at the top
and bottom. Horizontal reinforcement shall be provided in
accordance with Table R404.1.2 (1) . Vertical reinforcement
shall be provided in accordance with Table R404.1.2(2),
R404.1.2(3), R404.1.2(4), R404.1.2(5), R404.1.2(6),
R404.1.2(7), or R404.1.2(8), or Table R404.1.2(10) and
Figure R404.1.2(1) or Table R404.1.2(11) and Figure
R404.1.2(2). Vertical reinforcement for flat basement
walls retaining 4 feet (1219 mm) or more of unbalanced
backfill is permitted to be determined in accordance with
Table R404.1.2(9). For basement walls supporting above
grade concrete walls, vertical reinforcement shall be the
greater of that required by Tables R404.1.2(2) through
R404.1.2(8) or by Section R608.6 for the above-grade
wall. In buildings assigned to Seismic Design Category
Do, D1 or Dz, concrete foundation walls shall also comply
with Section R404.1.4.2.

(REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK)

5-7-11



Table R404.1.2(10) is hereby adopted as follows:

Table R404.1.2(10)

Foundation Wall Reinforcing

Active Pressure = 45pcft

Minimum Reinforcement for Concrete

Foundation Walls

Wall Height Wall Thickness Vertical
(h) feet (t) inches Reinforcing
#4 @ 24”7 o.c.
8
5 #5 @ 40” o.c.
#4 @30 o.c.
10
#5 @ 50” o.c.
#4 @ 18” o.c.
8
9 #5 @ 28” o.c.
#4 @ 24” o.c.
10
#5 @ 36” o.c.
#4 @ 16” o.c.
10 10
#5 @ 26” o.c.

Notes:

—

bk

Chart is based on an active soil pressure of'45 pounds per cubic foot (pcf).
Reinforcing steel shall be ASTM A615 Fy — 60,000 pounds per square inch
(psi).

The vertical reinforcing bars are to be located on the inside face.

Minimum concrete strength Fc' = 3,000 pounds per square inch (psi).

Backfill shall not be placed until first floor framing and sheathing is installed
and fastened or adequately braced and the concrete floor slab is in place or
the wall is adequately braced.

(Remainder of page intentionally left blank.)

5-7-12




TABLE R404.1.2(11) is added as follows:
Table R404.1.2(11)
Foundation Wall Reinforcing

Active Pressure = 65 pcf

Minimum Reinforcement for Concrete
Foundation Walls
Wall Height Wall Thickness Vertical
(h) Feet (t) inches Reimnforcing
#4 (@ 18” o.c.
8 #5 @ 26” o.c.
2 #6 @ 40” o.c.
#4 @ 24” o.c.
10 #5 @ 36 o.c.
#6 @ 52” o.c.
#4 @ 12 o.c.
8 #5 @ 187 o.c.
9 #6 @ 26” o.c.
#4 @ 16 o.c.
10 #5 @ 24” o.c.
#6 @ 36” o.c.
#4 @ 127 o.c.
10 10 #5 @ 18" o.c.
#6 @ 24” o.c.
Notes:
1. Chart is based on an active soil pressure of 65 pounds per cubic foot (pcf).
2 Remforcing steel shall be ASTM A615 Fy — 60,000 pounds per square inch
(psi).
3. The vertical reinforcing bars are to be located on the mside face.
4. Minimum concrete strength Fc' = 3,000 pounds per square inch (psi).
5. Backfill shall not be placed until first floor framing and sheathing is installed

and fastened or adequately braced and the concrete floor slab is in place or
the wall is adequately braced.

5-7-13



Figures R404.1.2(1) is hereby adopted as follows:

FIGURE R404.1.2(1)

N

Anchor Bolt

Per Code and
Desizn

Thickness ()

e

o Granvlar s

Fill ¥

Tinimum 1% Clear
Maximuem 2% Clear

#4at 2’0" o.c. Horizonal

F__/___,See Chart for V ertical Reinforcing

Dowels to hMateh ) .
Optional Location

Vertical _
Feinforcing fﬂf‘r apor Barrier

Tt ﬁ?’aﬂmﬂuﬁ.&r

Dirain Tile

PRk

Foh o o by b o ok o o ol o o
e

ptional Additional
Drain Tile

et e S

(Remainder of page intentionally left blank)

5-7-14



FIGURE 404.1.2(2) is hereby adopted as follows:

FIGURE R404.1.2(2)

i N

Anchor Bolt
Per Code and
Desien

Thidkness (f)

Mimimum 1377 Clear
Maimum 2857 Clear

#4 at 2’07 o.c. Horiz ontal

See Chartfor V ertical R einforcing

.:—'_'_'-'_'_'_F
Daowels to Match : .
W ertical Optional Location
Reirforcine //of Vapor Bamier
ﬁ‘u’aﬂor Earrier
| Opfional Additiondl
. [ fiiiiiin  DranTile

SECTION R405.2.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R405.2.3 Drainage system. In other than Group I
soils, a sump shall be provided to drain the porous layer
and footings. The sump shall be not less than 24 18
inches {610 in diameter or 26 16 inches square
0—61t29m°), shall extend not less than 24 inches (610 mm)
below the bottom of the basement floor and shall be
capable of positive gravity or mechanical drainage to
remove any accumulated water. The drainage system shall
discharge into an approved sewer system or to daylight.

5-7-15



SECTION R507.8.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION R602.7.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R602.7.2 Rim board headers. Rim board header size,
material and span shall be in accordance with Table
R602.7(1). Rim board headers shall be constructed in
accordance with Figure R602.7.2 and shall be supported at

each end by full- helght studs. Frermumberof—futi—teight

1 ul ] el h| £

Dl_uu.b CLL Cd.'vll cuu DllClJ_J_ L OAS) llUL 1S5S LliIdll UIIT 1ITUllioT L UL

DL,LAU.D U.J_DtJJ_CIL/CbL L)_Y J.lclJ_J_ UJ_ L,J.lC ILCO.U.CJ_ Dthtll UO.DCLJ. Ull L,lJ.C
2/

1T J_lllulll DL,L,[&,L Dldd.k/J_ll\j J_J.l O.k,bUJ_U.CiJ.lk/C WJ_ Lll J.O.L)J_C l\UU .« O \J} .

Rim board headers supporting concentrated loads shall be
designed in accordance with accepted engineering
practice.

SECTION R602.7.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R602.7.5 Supports for headers. Headers shall be supported
on each end with one or more jack studs or with approved
framing anchors in accordance with Table R602.7 (1) or
R602.7(2). The full-height stud adjacent to each end of
the header shall be end nailed to each end of the header
with four-16d nails (3.5 inches x 0.135 inches). The
lllillJ‘.lllulll LlulllbUJ_ Uf full ].lUij].lt Dtudb Clt Cdbll Clld Uf [=]

1 A h] | 1 . A L) Malal kWl a Ve W [
IITC4dUT L olldl 1 DT 111 dCLCOULUJdIICTS WLILILII 1dULltT INOU o [ e J e

TABLE R602.7.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION R602.10 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R602.10 Braced wall lines. For the purpose of
determining the amount and location of bracing required
in each story level of a building, braced wall lines
shall be designated as straight lines in the building
plan placed in accordance with this section.

Exception: The wall bracing requirements of
Section R602.10 of the 2006 International
Residential Code may be used as an alternative to
this section.

SECTION R703.7.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R703.7.2 Plaster. Plastering with portland
cement plaster shall be not less than three coats where
applied over metal lath or wire lath and shall be not
less than two coats where applied over masonry, concrete,
pressure-preservative treated wood or decay-resistant
wood as specified in Section R317.1 or gypsum backing.
If the plaster surface is completely covered by veneer or

5-7-16



other facing material or is completely concealed, plaster
application need be only two coats, provided the total
thickness is as set forth in Table 702.1(1). Approved
decorative coatings applied to a concrete or masonry
surface shall be installed in accordance with the
manufacturer’s installation instructions.

SECTION R806.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R806.1 Ventilation required. Enclosed attics and enclosed
rafter spaces formed where ceilings are applied directly
to the underside of roof rafters shall have cross
ventilation for each separate space by ventilating
openings protected against the entrance of rain or snow.
Ventilation openings shall have a least dimension of
1/16 inch (1.6 mm) minimum and 1/4 inch (6.4 mm) maximum.
Ventilation openings having a least dimension larger than
1/4 inch (6.4 mm) shall be provided with corrosion-
resistant wire cloth screening, hardware cloth or similar
material with openings having a least dimension of 1/16
inch (1.6 mm) minimum and 1/4 inch (6.4 mm) maximum.
Openings in roof framing members shall conform to the
requirements of Section R802.7. Required wventilation
openings shall open directly to the outside air.

Exception: Attic ventilation shall not be required
when determined to not be necessarv by the building
official due to atmospheric or climatic conditions.

SECTION R905.2.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R905.2.5 Fasteners. Fasteners for asphalt shingles shall
be galvanized steel, stainless steel, aluminum or copper
roofing nails, minimum 12 gage [0.105 inch (3 mm)] shank
with a minimum 3/8 inch diameter (9.5 mm) head, complying
with ASTM F 1667, of a length to penetrate through the
roofing materials and not less than % inch (19.1 mm) into
the roof sheathing or other fasteners as approved by the
building official and shingle manufacturer. Where the
roof sheathing is less than % inch (19.1 mm) thick, the
fasteners shall penetrate through the sheathing.

SECTION R908 is hereby deleted in its entirety and relocated
to the Appendices as Appendix R.

5-7-17



TABLE N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2) is hereby amended to read as

follows:
TABLEN1102.1.2 (R402.1.2)
INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT?
WOOD SLAB¢ CRAWL
SKYLIGHT GLAZED FRAMED MASS BASEMENT® R-VALUE SPACE®
CLIMATE FENESTRATION uU- FENESTRATION CEILING WALL WALL FLOOR WALL AND WALL
ZONE U-FACTOR® FACTOR® SHGC"® R-VALUE R-VALUE R-VALUE! R-VALUE R-VALUE DEPTH R-VALUE
1 NR 0.75 0.25! 30 13 3/4 13 0 0 0
2 0.40 0.65 0.35 38 13 4/6 13 0 0 0
20 or
3 0.35 0.55 0.35 38 13 +5h 7/13 19 5/13fF 0 5/13
4 except 20 or
Marine 0.35 0.55 0.40 49 13 +5h 8/13 19 10/13 10,2 fi. 10/13
5 and 20 or
Marine 4 032 0.55 NR 39 13 +5" 13/17 307 15/19 10,2 fi. 15/19
20+5-er
B0+
20 or =49
6 0.32 0.55 NR 19 13 +5hi 15/20 308 10/13 10,4 fi. 15/19
20+5-er
0"
20 or =49
7 and 8 0.32 0.55 NR 49 13 +5hi 19/21 38¢ 10/13 10, 41t 15/19

(REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK)

5-7-18




TABLE N1102.1.4 (R402.1.4) is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLEN1102.1.4 (R402.1.4)
EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS*
WOOD CRAWL
FRAMED MASS SPACE
SKYLIGHT® CEILING WALL WALL FLOOR BASEMENT® WALL
CLIMATE FENESTRATION U- uU- U- U- U- WALL U-
ZONE U-FACTOR® FACTOR® FACTOR FACTOR FACTOR® FACTOR U-FACTOR FACTOR
1 0.50 0.75 0.035 0.084 0.197 0.064 0.360 0477
2 0.40 0.65 0.030 0.084 0.165 0.064 0.360 0477
3 0.35 0.55 0.030 0.060 0.098 0.047 091¢ 0.136
4 except
Marine 0.35 0.55 0.026 0.060 0.098 0.047 0.059 0.065
5 and Marine
4 0.32 0.55 0.026 0.060 0.082 0.033 0.050 0.055
8645 865
6 0.32 0.55 0.026 0.057i 0.060 0.033 0.059 0.055
B HHs
7 and 8 0.32 0.55 0.026 0.057 0.057 0.028 0.059 0.055

SECTION N1102.1 (R402.4) is hereby amended to read as follows:

N1102.4 (R402.4) Air leakage (Mandatory). The building
thermal envelope shall be constructed to limit air
leakage in accordance with the requirements of
Sections N1102.4.1 through N1102.4.5. Dwelling units of
R-2 Occupancies and multiple single family dwellings
shall be permitted to comply with TIECC C402.5.

SECTION N1102.4.4.2 (R402.4.1.2) is hereby amended to read as
follows:

N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2) Testing. The building or
dwelling unit shall be tested and verified as having an
air leakage rate of not exceeding five air changes per
hour in Climate Zones 1 arc r‘, aIrcthrree—atr phaugco PTr
rour—im—EEtHmeate—Fomres—3 through 8. Testing shall be
conducted in accordance with ASTM E 779 or ASTM E 1827
and ..

5-7-19




SECTION N1102.4.1.3 (R402.4.1.3) is hereby added to read as
follows:

N1102.4.1.3 (R402.4.1.3) Visual inspection option.
Building envelope tightness and insulation shall be
considered acceptable when installed in accordance with
Table N1102.4.1.1 (R402.4.1.1) - ™“Air Barrier and
Insulation” and has been field verified.

SECTION N1103.3.2 (R403.3.2) is hereby amended to read as
follows:

N1103.3.2 (R403.3.2) Sealing (Mandatory). Ducts, air
handlers and filter boxes shall be sealed. Joints and
seams shall comply with either +the International
Mechanical Code or Section M1601.4.1 of this code, as
applicable.
Exceptions:
1. Air-impermeable spray foam products shall
be permitted to be applied without additional
joint seals.
2. For ducts having a static ©pressure
classification of less than 2 inches of water
column (500 Pa), additional closure systems
shall not be required for continuously welded
joints and seams, and locking-type joints and

= 1 1 ] 1 1 | 1 .
seams of—other—thar—tire STTaP—ITOCK alITa OUTCOIT

Tock—types.

SECTION N1103.3.5 (R403.3.5) is hereby amended to read as
follows:

N1103.3.5 (R403.3.5) Building cavities (Mandatory).
Building framing cavities shall not be used as supply
ducts or plcuumo.

SECTION N1103.6 (R403.6) is hereby amended to read as follows:

N1103.6 (R403.6) Mechanical Vventilation (Mandatory). The
building shall be provided with ventilation that meets
the requirements of Section M1507 of this code or the
International Mechanical Code, as applicable, or with
other approved means of ventilation. Outdoor air intakes
and exhausts shall have automatic or gravity dampers that
close when the ventilation system is not operating.

5-7-20



TABLE N1105.5.2 (1) [R405.5.2 (1)] is hereby amended to read
as follows:

TABLE N1105.5.2(1) [R405.5.2(1)]
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE STANDARD REFERENCE AND PROPOSED DESIGNS

BUILDING
COMPONENT STANDARD REFERENCE DESIGN PROPOSED DESIGN

Arr leakage rate of 5 air changes per hour in For residences that are
Climate Zones 1 and2;and-3-archangesperhour  |not tested, the same air
Iin-Glﬁafe—Zcmcs—} through 8 at a pressure 0f 0.2 leakage rate as the
inches w.g changes per hour in Climate Zones 3 standard reference
through 8 at a pressure of 0.2 inches w.g (50 Pa). design.
The mechanical ventilation rate shall be in addition For tested residences,

Air exchange rate to the air leakage rate and the same as in the the measured air
proposed design, but no greater than 0.01 x CFA +  |exchange rate®.
7.5 x (Nbr + 1) The mechanical
where: ventilation rate® shall
CFA = conditioned floor area be in addition to the air
Nbr = number of bedrooms leakage rate and shall
Energy recovery shall not be assumed for be as proposed.
mechanical ventilation.

SECTION M1301.1.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION M1401.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION M1502.4.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

M1502.4.2 Duct installation. Exhaust ducts shall be
supported at intervals not to exceed 12 feet (3658 mm)
and shall be secured in place. The insert end of the duct
shall extend into the adjoining duct or fitting in the
direction of airflow. Exhaust duct joints shattTe—=seated

Tm—accordanrce withr Sectiomr M0t A T —and—shatt may be
mechanically fastened. Ducts shall not be joined with

. .~ e 1 | ) | Q
sScrews or—sImrrar fastenmrers—thatprotrudemore—theamr 73

. h) Vo) (o) \ . . ) . —l Wl ] ] .
LITCII (O . LTI LITLOU LIS 11T LU UL Ll JducTu.
SECTION M1503.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

M1503.4 Makeup air required. Exhaust hood systems capable
of exhausting in excess of 400 cubic feet per minute
(0.19 m3/s) shall be mechanically or naturally provided
with makeup air at a rate approximately equal to the
exhaust air rate in excess of 400 cfm. Such makeup air
systems shall be equipped with not less than one damper.
FEach damper shall be a gravity damper or an electrically
operated damper that automatically opens when the exhaust

5-7-21




system operates. Dampers shall be accessible for
inspection, service, repair and replacement without
removing permanent construction or any other ducts not
connected to the damper being inspected, serviced,
repaired or replaced.

SECTION M1506.3 is hereby amended read as follows:

M1506.2 Exhaust openings. Air exhaust openings
shall terminate not less than 3 feet (914 mm) from
property lines; 3 feet (914 mm) from operable ard
o operabte openings into the building and 10 feet
(3048 mm) from mechanical air intakes except where
the opening is located 3 feet (914 mm) above the
air intake. Openings shall comply with Sections
R303.5.2 and R303.6.

SECTION M1601.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

M1601.4.1 Joints, seams and connections. Longitudinal and
transverse joints, seams and connections in metallic and
nonmetallic ducts shall be constructed ..

Exceptions:
1. Spray polyurethane foam shall be permitted
to be applied without additional joint seals.
2. Where a duct connection is made that 1is
partially inaccessible, three screws or rivets
shall be equally spaced on the exposed portion
of the joint so as to prevent a hinge effect.

3. For ducts having a static ©pressure
classification of less than 2 inches of water
column (500 Pa), additional closure systems

shall not be required for continuously welded
joints and seams and locking-type joints and

seams of—other—thamrthe—srmap—tock—=amrdtTuttonr—
Tock—types.

SECTION M1601.4.10 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION M1701.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION M1801.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

M1801.1 Venting required. Fuel-burning appliances shall
be vented to the outdoors in accordance with their
listing and Iabel and manufacturer’s installation

instructions except—appliances listed and labeled for

unverted—use. Venting systems shall consist of approved

5-7-22



chimneys or wvents, or venting assemblies that are
integral parts of lIabeled appliances. Gas fired
appliances shall be vented in accordance with Chapter 24.

SECTION M2001.4 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION M2005.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

M2005.1 General. Water heaters shall be installed in
accordance with €hapter—28 the North Dakota State
Plumbing Code, the manufacturer's instructions and the
requirements of this code. Water heaters installed in an
attic shall comply with the requirements of Section
M1305.1.3. Gas-fired water heaters shall comply with the
requirements in Chapter 24. Domestic electric water
heaters shall comply with UL 174. Oiled-fired water
heaters shall comply with UL 732. Thermal solar water
heaters shall comply with Chapter 23 and UL 174. Solid
fuel-fired water heaters shall comply with UL 2523.

SECTION M2101.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

M2101.3 Protection of potable water. The potable water
system shall be protected from backflow in accordance
with the provisions listed in—Sectiomr—P2962 the North
Dakota State Plumbing Code.

SECTION M2101.10 is hereby amended to read as follows:

M2101.10 Tests. New Hhydronic piping shall be isolated
and tested hydrostatically at a pressure of ore—andore

et ftimes—the meaximum systemr desigr pressure, but—not
less than 100 pounds per square inch (689 kPa). The
duration of each test shall be not less than 15 minutes
and not more than 20 minutes.

SECTION M2103.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

M2103.3 Piping joints. Copper and copper alloy systems
shall be soldered in accordance with ASTM B 828. Fluxes
for soldering shall be in accordance with ASTM B 813.
Brazing fluxes shall be in accordance with AWS A5.31.
Piping joints that are embedded shall be installed in
accordance with the following requirements:

1. Steel pipe joints shall be welded.

2. Copper tubing shall be Jjoined by brazing

complying with SecttomrP3663-6-T the North Dakota

State Plumbing Code.

3. Polybutylene pipe and tubing joints

5-7-23



SECTION M2201.6 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION G2404.7 (301.11) is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION G2406.2 (303.3) is hereby amended to read as follows:

G2406.2 (303.3) Prohibited locations. Appliances shall
not be located in sleeping rooms, bathrooms, toilet
rooms, storage closets or surgical rooms, or in a space
that opens only into such rooms or spaces, except where
the installation complies with one of the following:
1. The appliance 1s a direct-vent appliance
installed in accordance with the conditions of the
listing and the manufacturer’s instructions.
2. Vented room heaters, wall furnaces, vented
decorative appliances, vented gas fireplaces,
vented gas fireplace heaters and decorative
appliances for installation in vented solid
fuel-burning fireplaces are installed in rooms that
meet the required volume criteria of Section

2 2 4 ul 17 o \| . 1 1 L .
O Ao llIyglIT Wadl 17Ut TeU " UlIveEIlIltTeud LT UUIN 1ISadtlT L LS
. . q1 1 i . 1 L, .l 1 . .l
LTIIolLdl I T©U LIT d UAaUIT L UUIIN dITU o UTIT UITVTITUTU L OUI

h) e . . A L=l 1l . Q I P Na W W
IICeatT Ll ITo TUuUlIppTu ado opTUl Il L I1TU 1TIImoTCUCLIUIlIGZ2a733IJ. 0

] h) . e N e e ] raWaWal
dllU 1I1ado dll LITPUL Ladltllly ITOC gL<TadlTl Clliall O, UUU
A Vi) Via o ] L AN ol 1 ) 1 1.7 e i)
DDLU/ 1L \L .70 KW ) . 11IT OdadUlllL OUIML olld L L [T L LLIIT

: A | L . o . o0 ANT [
LCcyuLrtrTu vVOLUIlT CL1ILTSL 1Id UL oTULLUIT GZ23U 7 .J%.
Vil .Y . ul 13 . | . ] i) . .
=30 Ao llIyglIT Wadl 1I7IUUITItTEU " UlIIveEITtLTUu L UUIN 1ISadtlT L LS
. - 1 1 ] . 1 ] 1 o - |
LlIotltdl 1ITU L1l =} DTUL UUIL alltl o UTIT UllvelilttTu L OUUILL
] . . . ] — | . fal . Vo R W, B
IIeatTrl 1T o TyulppTtu adas ocpTcU 1l L ITTU T oTUCL LUl G233 J .0

NI h) .. K. " . . ] 1N aWaWay
dlTa1Ias dl1TITputL L atllIly ITOLU " yr<adtTlh ClIIdll 11U, UUU
R V) LD o 1Tl ) ml ] ] i) i | . ]
DDLU/ II \ « J O KW ) . 11IT LDCUL OUIIl olld L L JIISASa S LIIT

. 1 ul e . W Q N aRalV, Walw] [
LUl TcuUu VOLUIT CL 1Ll 1d UL oTULLUIl "G5 U 7 .0

53. The appliance is installed in a room or space
that opens only into a bedroom or bathroom, and
such room or space is used for no other purpose and
is provided with a solid weather-stripped door
equipped with an approved self-closing device. All
combustion air shall be taken directly from the
outdoors in accordance with Section G2407.6.

Figure G2407.6.1(1) [304.6.1(1)] is hereby deleted in its
entirety.

Figure G2407.6.1(2) [304.6.1(2)] is hereby deleted in its
entirety.

5-7-24



Figure G2407.6.2 (304.6.2) is hereby amended to read as

follows:
j[i

= CHIMMNEY DR GAS VENT

™~

}-  OPENING

—ALTERMATE OFEMING
LOCATICN

7

Ul 2

SECTION G2407.11 (304.11) is hereby amended to read as
follows:

G2407.11 (304.11) Combustion air ducts. Combustion air
ducts shall comply with all the following:

1. Ducts shall be constructed of galvanized
steel complying with Chapter 16 or of a
material having equivalent corrosion .

5. Ducts shall not be screerred wirere
termimatimrg terminate in an attic space.
6. Horizontal upper combustion air ducts shall

not slope downward
SECTION G2413.5 (402.5) is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section G2413.5 (402.5) Allowable pressure drop. The
design pressure loss in any piping system under maximum
probable flow conditions, from the point of delivery to
the inlet connection of the appliance, shall be such that
the supply pressure at the appliance is greater than or
equal to the minimum pressure required by the appliance
but such pressure 1loss shall not be greater than 0.5 inch
water column for gas pipe systems operating at less than

2 psi.

5-7-25



SECTION G2417.4.1 (406.4.1) is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Section G2417.4.1 (406.4.1) Test pressure. The test
pressure to be used shall be not less than 1*» times the
proposed maximum working pressure, but not less than 3
25 psig t20kPagauge), irrespective of design pressure.
Where the test pressure exceeds 125 psig (862 kPa gauge),
the test pressure shall not exceed a value that produces
a hoop stress in the piping greater than 50 percent of

the specified minimum yield strength of the pipe.

SECTION G2425.8 (501.8) is hereby amended to read as follows:

G2425.8 (501.8) Appliances not required to be vented. The
following appliances shall not be required to be vented:

1. Ranges.

2. Built-in domestic cooking units listed and
marked for optional venting.

3. Hot plates and laundry stoves.

4. Type 1 clothes dryers (Type 1 clothes dryers

shall be exhausted in accordance with the
requirements of Section G2439).

5. Refrigerators.

6. Counter appliances.

J+— Room heaters listed for unvented use-

Where the appliances listed in Items 5 through—+ and 6
above are installed so that the aggregate input rating
exceeds 20 Btu per hour per cubic foot (207 W/m®) of
volume of the room or space in which such appliances are
installed, one or more shall be provided with venting
systems or other approved means for conveying the vent
gases to the outdoor atmosphere so that the aggregate
input rating of the remaining unvented appliances does
not exceed 20 Btu per hour cubic foot (207 W/m®) . Where
the room or space in which the appliance is installed is
directly connected to another room or space by a doorway,
archway or other opening of comparable size that cannot
be closed, the volume of such adjacent room or space
shall be permitted to be included in the calculations.

SECTION G2425.12 (501.12) is hereby amended to read as
follows:

G2425.12 (501.12) Residential and low-heat appliances
flue lining systems. Flue Iining systems for use with
residential-type and low-heat appliances shall be limited
to the following:

5-7-26



1. Clay flue lining complying with the
requirements of ASTM C 315 or equivalent when
each appliance connected into the masonry
chimney has a minimum input rating of greater
than 400,000 Btu/h. Clay flue lining shall be
installed in accordance with Chapter 10.

2. Listed chimney lining systems complying
with UL 1777.
3. Other approved materials that will resist,

without cracking, softening or corrosion, flue
gases and condensate at temperatures up to
1,800°F (982°C).

a. Aluminum (1100 or 3003 alloy or
equivalent) not less than 0.032 inches
thick up to 8 inches in diameter.

b. Stainless steel (304 or 430 alloy or
equivalent) not less than 26 gauge (0.018
inches thick) to 8 inches in diameter or
not less than 24 gauge (0.024 inches
thick) 8 inches in diameter and larger.

When a metal liner is used other than a listed
chimney liner a condensation drip tee shall be
installed and supported in an approved manner.

SECTION G2427.5.2 (503.5.3) is hereby amended to read as
follows:

G2427.5.2 (503.5.3) Masonry chimneys. Masonry chimneys

{982° C)y as per G2425.12.

Exception: Masonry chimney flues serving
listed gas

SECTION G2439.7.2 (614.8.2) is hereby amended to read as
follows:

G2439.7.2 (614.8.2) Duct installation. Exhaust ducts
shall be supported at 4-foot (1219 mm) intervals and
secured in place. The insert end of the duct shall extend
into the adjoining duct or fitting in the direction of
airflow. Ducts shall not be joined with screws or—simitar

Wy e ) e e 1 i) | Q . h| L la) \ . e
LdoLTIITL o LiIIdl PpLULLUUT [MULT LlIdll 1 O LIITIDL (o. ) LI O

) : LA o 1 A
Ll LIS 1L UT ULl Ll Uuucut.

5-7-27



SECTION G2442.5 (618.5) is hereby amended to read as follows:

G2442.5 (618.5) Screen. Required outdoor air inlets
shall be covered with a screen having * inch (6.4 mm)
openings. Required outdoor air inlets serving a
nonresidential portion of a building shall be covered
with screen having openings larger than ¥ inch but not
larger than *» inch.

SECTION G2445 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
CHAPTERS 25 THROUGH 43 are hereby deleted in their entirety.

5-0703. PENALTY. A violation of the regulations contained in
this chapter shall be deemed an offense and shall be punishable by
a fine of not to exceed Five Hundred Dollars ($500). Each day that
a violation is permitted to exist shall constitute a separate
offense. The provisions of Section 1-0211 shall also apply.

5-0704. FEE FOR COPY OF RELEVANT CODE PROVISIONS. Every
licensed contractor, pursuant to Chapter 43-07 of the North Dakota
Century Code, upon applying for a building permit, shall be
provided a copy of the Building Code Ordinances of the City of
Mapleton and the relevant portions of the International Residential
Code adopted by the City which apply to residential construction.
The contractor will be charged a fee for such copies in an amount
set by the City Council. A contractor will only be provided one
copy of the International Residential Code sections and pay one fee
for residential construction, no matter how many building permits
are requested by that particular contractor. Provided, however,
that if the City later adopts another Building Code, the contractor
will again be required to pay another fee to get the revised
Building Code provisions. Notwithstanding the above provisions, if
a contractor shows the Building Official his/her copy of the
appropriate Building Code, then the contractor shall just be
supplied a copy of the Mapleton Building Code Ordinances and shall
not be required to be provided nor pay the charge for obtaining a
copy of the relevant Building Code.

5-0705. Appeals. A person shall have the right to appeal a
decision of the Code Official to the Board of Appeals. The
Mapleton City Council shall be the Board of Appeals. An appeal in
writing to the Code Official must be made within 20 days of the
decision of the Code Official. The Mapleton City Council shall
hear the appeal within 30 days of the Code Official receiving
written notice of the appeal. The Council may only reverse or
modify a decision of the Code Official by a vote of at least three
members of the Council. If not all members of the Council are
present at the hearing, the person appealing the decision may
request a postponement, which may extend the 30-day period to hold

5-7-28



such a hearing. An application for an appeal shall be based on a
claim that the true intent of the Code has been incorrectly
interpreted, the provisions of the Code do not fully apply, or an
equally good or better form of construction is proposed. The
Council shall have no authority to waive requirements of the Code.

5-7-29



CHAPTER 5-08

INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE

SECTIONS:
5-0801. Adoption of International Existing Building Code.
5-0802. Amendment to International Existing Building Code.

(Source: Ord. 239-18)
5-0803. Penalty.
5-0804. Appeals.

5-0801. ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE.
There is hereby adopted by reference by the City Council, for the
purpose of prescribing regulations governing standards, relative to
housing in the City of Mapleton, that certain code known as the
International Existing Building Code, recommended and compiled by
the International Code Council, being particularly the 2015 edition
thereof, as the same are now established in said code, a copy of
which is on file in the office of the Building Administrator for
the City of Mapleton, with the exception of the sections
hereinafter set forth affecting local conditions of the City of
Mapleton, which sections shall be substituted for and in lieu of
like sections or paragraphs in said International Existing Building
Code; the City Council of said City of Mapleton, by this section
hereby approves and adopts such rules and regulations, so modified,
for the use and application within the city limits of Mapleton,
North Dakota, as well as for any area within the extraterritorial
zoning jurisdiction of the City. Provided, that any amendments of
the 2015 edition of the Code may be adopted by the City by
resolution.

5-0802. AMENDMENT TO INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE.
The International Existing Building Code, as adopted in
Section 5-0801 is hereby changed and amended as follows:

SECTION 101.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the

Existing Building Code of ANAMEOFJORTSBICTION) the City
of Mapleton hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

SECTION 101.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.2 Scope. The provisions of the International Existing
Building Code shall apply to the repair, alteration,
change of occupancy, addition to and relocation of
existing buildings.

5-8-1



Exception: Existing buildings may use Chapter 34 of
the 2012 International Building Code as an
alternative to this code.

SECTION 104.2.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

104.2.1.1 Building evaluation. The code official 1is
authorized to require an existing building to be
investigated and evaluated at the owner’s expense by a
registered design professional based on the circumstances
agreed upon at the preliminary meeting. The design
professional shall notify the code official if any
potential nonconformance with the provisions of this code
is identified.

SECTION 104.8 is hereby amended to add a new final paragraph
to read as follows:

[A] 104.8 Liability. The building official, member of the
board of appeals or employee charged with the enforcement
of this code. While acting for the jurisdiction in good
faith and without malice in the discharge of the duties
required by this code or other pertinent law or
ordinance, shall not thereby be pivilly Or pLLmiually
rendered liable personally and is hereby relieved from
personal liability for any damage accruing to persons or
property as a result of any act or by reason of an act or
omission in the discharge of official duties. Any suit
instituted against an officer or emplovyee because of an
act or omission performed by that officer or employee in
the lawful discharge of duties and under the provisions
of this code shall be afforded all the protection
provided by the city’s insurance pool and immunities and
defenses provided by other applicable state and federal
laws and shall be defended by legal representative of the
jurisdiction until the final termination of the
proceedings. The building official or any subordinate
shall not be liable for the cost in any action, suit or
proceeding that is instituted in pursuant of the
provisions of this code.

This code shall not be construed to relieve from or
lessen the responsibility of any person owning,
operating, or controlling any building or structure for
any damages to persons or property caused by defects, nor
shall the code enforcement agency or the city be held as
assuming any such liability by reason of the inspection
authorized by this code or any permits or certificates
issued under this code.

5-8-2



SECTION 104.8.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 104.10.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 105.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

105.2 Work exempt from permit. Exemptions from permit
requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant
authorization for any work to be done in any manner in
violation of the provisions of this code or any other
laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction. Permits shall
not be required for the following:

Building:
1. Sidewalks, retaining walls, and driveways
not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above grade
and not over any basement or story below and
that are not part of an accessible route.

2. Painting, papering, tiling

6. Movable cases, counters and partitions
not over 96 inches (1753 mm) in height.

7. Reroofing.

SECTION 106.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

106.3.1. Approval of construction documents. When the
code official... ...0One set of construction documents so
reviewed shall be retained by the code official. Fhe

. e 1 J ) e .l e . - . 1 i | 1
OLlliclL oStTl olldall DT LTLULIITU LU LIIT adappL1litdlll, olld L L T

1 e NI | e Wl hl ] h) | h) . . N
ATCpPpL 4dl LIIT o1 LT UL WOLRKA 4dllU oSlldal 1l DT UpPTIl LU LIIopPTUULLUILI

b ] 1 i P I o2 . ul h] 1 ul ) : A
oy LIIT OULILULIIY UL 1L 1CIadl UL Uy =} Uuly AdAULIIUOL 1T 42TU

SECTION 109.3.3 is hereby deleted in its entirety and
subsequent sections renumbered accordingly.

SECTION 112 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 201.3 is hereby amended to add the following:
201.3 Terms defined in other codes. Where terms are not
defined in the other International Codes, such terms

shall have the meanings ascribed to them in those codes.

Wherever the term “International Plumbing Code” and/or
the “International Private Sewage Disposal Code” is used

5-8-3



in this Code, it shall mean the North Dakota State
Plumbing Code. Wherever the term “ICC Electrical Code” is
used in this Code, it shall mean the National Electric
Code together with the ©North Dakota State Wiring
Standards. Wherever the term “Flood Hazard Area” is used,
it shall mean the West Fargo Flood Plain Management
ordinance together with the Flood Proofing Code of the

City of West Fargo, North Dakota.

SECTION

SECTION

SECTION

SECTION

SECTION

SECTION

SECTION

SECTION

SECTION

SECTION

402.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
403.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
404.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
408.2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
601.3 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
606.2.4 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
701.3 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
1103.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
1201.4 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

1301.2 is hereby amended by adding a new second

paragraph to read as follows:

1301.2 Conformance. The buitdimg—shattPbe—safefortmumen

: . L ] . 1 :

. i . N h) = ] . hl
Lcpallty, adallctdlL1Ull, UL CllIallgS UL UOLLUUPAllly UllUT L LAaRKCTII

LI, PR i) 1 e e h| 1.7 ul LI i)
WILULCIILII LIIT JINIGAVAS IV o LLUCLULLT olld L L CUINIP LY WL LIl LIIT

Buildings to be moved within this Jjurisdiction shall

comply with provisions of this Chapter. Buildings to be
moved into this jurisdiction shall comply with the
provisions of the International Codes for new buildings
and shall be certified as to that compliance by an agency
approved by the code official.

SECTION 1302.6 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

5-8-4



SECTION 1401.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1401.2 Applicability. Structures existing prior to tPATE
PO BEINSERTEDBYTHEJIFURTSBFCTFONT 1952 in which there
is work involving additions, alterations, or changes of
occupancy shall be made to conform to the requirements of
this chapter or the provisions of Chapters 4 through 12.
The provisions of Section 1301.2.1 through 1301.2.5 shall
apply to existing occupancies that will continue to be,
or are proposed to be, in Groups A, B, E, F, M, R, and S.
These provisions shall not apply to buildings with
occupancies in Group H or Group I-1, I-3 or I-4.

5-0803. Penalty. Any person violating any provision of the
International Existing Building Code adopted by this title or any
section of this title shall be guilty of an infraction and shall be
subject to the penalties set forth in Section 1-0211. Each day
such violation continues shall be considered a separate offense.

5-0804. Appeals. A person shall have the right to appeal a
decision of the Code Official to the Board of Appeals. The
Mapleton City Council shall be the Board of Appeals. An appeal in
writing to the Code Official must be made within 20 days of the
decision of the Code Official. The Mapleton City Council shall
hear the appeal within 30 days of the Code Official receiving
written notice of the appeal. The Council may only reverse or
modify a decision of the Code Official by a vote of at least three
members of the Council. If not all members of the Council are
present at the hearing, the person appealing the decision may
request a postponement, which may extend the 30-day period to hold
such a hearing. An application for an appeal shall be based on a
claim that the true intent of the Code has been incorrectly
interpreted, the provisions of the Code do not fully apply, or an
equally good or better form of construction is proposed. The
Council shall have no authority to waive requirements of the Code.

5-8-5



CHAPTER 5-09

INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

SECTIONS:
5-0901. Adoption of International Energy Conservation Code.
5-0902. Amendment to International Energy Conservation

Code. (Source: Ord. 238-18)
5-0903. Penalty.
5-0904. Appeals.

5-0901. ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE.
There is hereby adopted by reference by the City Council, for the
purpose of prescribing regulations governing standards, relative to
housing in the City of Mapleton, that certain code known as the
International Energy Conservation Code, recommended and compiled by
the International Code Council, being particularly the 2015 edition
thereof, as the same are now established in said code, a copy of
which is on file in the office of the Building Administrator for
the City of Mapleton, with the exception of the sections
hereinafter set forth affecting local conditions of the City of
Mapleton, which sections shall be substituted for and in lieu of
like sections or paragraphs in said International Energy
Conservation Code; the City Council of said City of Mapleton, by
this section hereby approves and adopts such rules and regulations,
so modified, for the use and application within the city limits of
Mapleton, ©North Dakota, as well as for any area within the
extraterritorial zoning jurisdiction of the City. Provided, that
any amendments of the 2015 edition of the Code may be adopted by
the City by resolution.

Source: Ord. 238-18

5-0902. AMENDMENT TO INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE.
The International Energy Conservation Code, as adopted in
Section 5-0901 is hereby changed and amended as follows:

SECTION C101.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Cl01.1 Title. This <code shall be known as the
International Energy Conservation Code of NAME—OF

JURISDICTION] City of Mapleton, and shall be cited as
such. It is referred to herein as “this code.”

SECTION C109 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

5-9-1



TABLE R402.1.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLER402.1.2
INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT ¢
WOOD SLAB* CRAWL
SKYLIGHT® GLAZED FRAMED MASS FLOOR BASEMENT R-VALUE SPACE"
CLIMATE FENESTRATION U- FENESTRATION CEILING WALL WALL R-VALUE © AND WALL
Z0NE U-FACTOR" FACTOR® SHGC" « R- R-VALUE R-VALUE' WALL DEPTH R-VALUE
VALUE R-VALUE
1 NR 0.75 025 30 13 3/4 13 0 0 0
2 0.40 0.65 025 38 13 4/6 13 0 0 0
20 or
3 0.35 0.55 025 38 7/13 19 5/13f 0 5/13
13 +5"
4 except 20 or
0.35 0.55 0.40 49 8/13 19 10/13 10,2 f. 10/13
Marine 13 +5"
5 and 20 or
0.32 0.55 NR 49 13/17 30° 15/19 10,2 ft. 15/19
Marine 4 13 +5°
20-+5-of
3o+ 545
6 0.32 0.55 NR 19 15/20 30¢ 10,4 ft. 15/19
20 or 10/13
13 +50
7 and 8 0.32 0.55 NR 49 20—+5-or 19/21 38¢ +HHS 10,4 f. 15/19
B0+ 10/13
20 or
13 +50

(Remainder of page intentionally

5-9-2

left blank)




TABLE R402.1.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLER402.1.4

EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS?®
WOOD CRAWL
FRAMED MASS SPACE
CEILING WALL WALL FLOOR BASEMENT WALL
CLIMATE FENES TRATION SKYLIGHT® U- U- U- U- WALL U-
ZONE U-FACTOR® U-FACTOR® FACTOR | FACTOR FACTOR® FACTOR U-FACTOR FACTOR
1 0.50 0.75 0.035 0.084 0.197 0.064 0.360 0.477
2 0.40 0.65 0.030 0.084 0.165 0.064 0.360 0.477
3 0.35 0.55 0.030 0.060 0.098 0.047 .091¢ 0.136
4 except
Marine 0.35 0.55 0.026 0.060 0.098 0.047 0.059 0.065
5and
Marine 4 0.32 0.55 0.026 0.060 0.082 0.033 0.050 0.055
0-645 0-65
6 0.32 0.55 0.026 0.057 0.060 0.033 0.059 0.055
0-645 065
7 and 8 0.32 0.55 0.026 0.057 0.057 0.028 0.059 0.055

SECTION R402.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R402.4 Air leakage (Mandatory). The building thermal
envelope shall be constructed to limit air leakage in
accordance with the requirements of Sections R402.4.1
through R402.4.4. Dwelling units of R-2 Occupancies and

multiple single family dwellings shall be permitted to

comply with IECC C402.5.

SECTION R402.4.1.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R402.4.1.2 Testing. The building or dwelling unit shall
be tested and verified as having an air leakage rate of
not exceeding five air changes per hour in Climate Zones

1 Cl.lld 2, Ctlld thJ_CC GLJl_J_ phaugco pTL hou_ Jl_ll Climatc ZUJ.J.CD
3 through 8. Testing shall be conducted in accordance
with ASTM E 779 or ASTM E 1827 and ..

5-9-3




SECTION R402.4.1.3 is hereby added to read as follows:

R402.4.1.3 Visual inspection option. Building envelope
tightness and insulation shall be considered acceptable
when installed in accordance with Table R402.4.1.1 — “Air
Barrier and Insulation” and has been field verified.

SECTION R403.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R403.3.2 Sealing (Mandatory). Ducts, air handlers and
filter boxes shall be sealed. Joints and seams shall
comply with either the International Mechanical Code or
Section M1601.4.1 of this code, as applicable.

Exceptions:

1. Air-impermeable spray foam products shall
be permitted to be applied without additional
joint seals.

2. For ducts having a static pressure
classification of less than 2 inches of water
column (500 Pa), additional closure systems
shall not be required for continuously welded
joints and seams, and locking-type joints and

g 1 1 1 | 1 11
seams ofothrer—theamr tire—smap—tock ardoutton

| 1 .
TOCK Ctypes.

SECTION R403.3.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R403.3.5 Building cavities (Mandatory). Building framing

cavities shall not be used as supply ducts or—pterums.

SECTION R403.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R403. 6 Mechaniecal Vventilation (Mandatory) . The building
shall be provided with wventilation that meets the
requirements of Section MI1507 of this code or the
International Mechanical Code, as applicable, or with
other approved means of ventilation. Outdoor air intakes
and exhausts shall have automatic or gravity dampers that
close when the ventilation system is not operating.

5-9-4



TABLE R405.5.2 (1) is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R405.5.2(1)

SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE STANDARD REFERENCE AND PROPOSED DESIGNS

BUILDING
COMPONENT

STANDARD REFERENCE DESIGN

PROPOSED
DESIGN

Air exchange rate

Air leakage rate of 5 air changes per hour in Climate Zones 1
atrd-2-and 3airchanges perhourin-Chmate Zones3 through
8 at a pressure of 0.2 inches w.g changes per hour in Climate
Zones 3 through 8 at a pressure of 0.2 inches w.g (50 Pa). The
mechanical ventilation rate shall be in addition to the air
leakage rate and the same as in the proposed design, but no

For residences that are not
tested, the same air leakage
rate as the standard
reference design.

For tested residences, the
measured air exchange

rate®.

The mechanical ventilation
rate® shall be in addition to
the air leakage rate and
shall be as proposed.

oreater than 0.01 X CFA + 7.5 x (Nbr + 1)

where:

CFA = conditioned floor area

INbr = number of bedrooms

Energy recovery shall not be assumed for mechanical
ventilation.

5-0903. Penalty. Any person violating any provision of the
International Energy Conservation Code adopted by this title or any
section of this title shall be guilty of an infraction and shall be
subject to the penalties set forth in Section 1-0211. Each day such
violation continues shall be considered a separate offense.

5-0904. Appeals. A person shall have the right to appeal a
decision of the Code Official to the Board of Appeals. The Mapleton
City Council shall be the Board of Appeals. An appeal in writing to
the Code Official must be made within 20 days of the decision of the
Code Official. The Mapleton City Council shall hear the appeal
within 30 days of the Code Official receiving written notice of the
appeal. The Council may only reverse or modify a decision of the
Code Official by a vote of at least three members of the Council.
If not all members of the Council are present at the hearing, the
person appealing the decision may request a postponement, which may
extend the 30-day period to hold such a hearing. An application for
an appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of the Code
has been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of the Code do not
fully apply, or an equally good or better form of construction is
proposed. The Council shall have no authority to waive requirements
of the Code.

5-9-5



